Taylor, Mark C HLTH:EX

C—
From: Wang, Hong (May) HLTH:EX
Sent: Monday, July 7, 2014 8:19 AM
To: Taylor, Mark C HLTH:EX
Subject: RE: 2013/14 Station Street Property Taxes
~
~Hi Mark -
Yes, The $800K was included in the v
Thanks.
May Wang

Financial Analyst, Regional Grants
Regional Grants and Decision Support
Ministry of Health

Tel: 260-952-2299 Fax: 250-952-1420

From: Taylor, Mark C HLTH:EX

Sent: Friday, July 4, 2014 9:07 AM

To: Wang, Hong (May) HLTH:EX

Subject: 2013/14 Station Street Property Taxes

Hi May,

$.13,8.17

Please review with me on Monday — thanks.

Mark C. Taylor

Director - Policy, Finance and Funding
Regional Grants and Decision Support
Ministry of Health

Phone: 250-952-1177 Fax: 250-852-1420
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Taxlor, Mark € HLTH:EX

From; Perry, Nancy L HLTH:EX

Sent: Wednesday, February 26, 2014 3:33 AM
To: Taylor, Mark C HLTH:EX

Subject: FW: Station Street Property Taxes
Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Categories: Red Category

Please see Manjit’s instructions below.

From: Perry, Nancy L HLTHIEX
Sent: February-17-14 9:28 AM
To: Cross, Gordon HLTH:EX
Subject: Station Street Property Taxes

Hi Gordon, please see note below from Manjit. Thanks.

Nancy

Cliff Number: 1004227

Topic: Taxes for the Property Located on Station Street
Date Final Due: 2/20/2014 12:00:00 AM

Last Action: Item Sent To

Comments:
2014/02/17T09:23 nkiewiet (FCS-ADM) Manjit did not approved with comments "Gord, can we just add
this to the final funding lettei”
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Buckland, Arthur HLTH:EX

_ =

From: Taylor, Mark C HLTH:EX
Sent: Thursday, February 13, 2014 10:36 AM
To: © Cross, Gordon HLTH:EX
Subject: § RE: Station Street Property Tax

a

&
Ok thanks -3

Mark C. Taylor

Director - Policy, Finance and Funding
Regional Grants and Decision Support
Ministry of Health

Phore: 250-852-1177 Fax: 250-952-1420

From: Cross, Gordon HLTH:EX

Sent: February-13-14 10:31 AM

To: Taylor, Mark C HLTH:EX

Subject: Re: Station Street Property Tax

No, we have to do a letter for manjif, route it through and get approval first...

Thanks.

From: Taylor, Mark C HLTH:EX

Sent: Thursday, February 13, 2014 10:06 AM Pacific Standard Time
Jo: Cross, Gordon HLTH:EX

-Subject: Station Street Property Tax

§1i Gord,
g

14

°

P4

20k to include $800,000 in the

g

g

o

g
Thanks.

Mark C. Taylor

Director - Policy, Finance and Funding
Regional Grants and Decision Support
Ministry of Health

Phone: 250-952-1177 Fax: 250-852-1420

to VCHA (for Station Street Property Taxes)?

Not Responsive
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Hitchman, Har:z JHLTH:EX

From: Hitchman, Harry J HLTH:EX

Sent: Thursday, February 6, 2014 1:31 PM
To: XT:HLTH Yung, Helen

Subject: . RE: Station Street property tax

Hi Helen

t understand there is a high probability it will be funded, but not confirmed unti final funding lefter, as in prior years.

From: Yung, Helen [VA] [malito:Helen.Yung@vch.ca)
Sent: February-06-14 12:21 PM

To: Hitchman, Harry J HLTH:EX

Subject: FW: Station Street property tax

Hi Harry, could you please look into this for us?

Thanks,
Helen

From: Wong, Amanda [PH]

Sent: Thursday, February 06, 2014 11:13 AM
To: Yung, Helen [VA]

Subject: Station Street property tax

Hi Helen,
Just wondering if you have heard anything from MOH about the funding for 13/14 year regarding the captioned.

Thank you.
Amanda

HTH-2014-00340
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Hitchman, Harry J HLTH:EX
Ee————

From: Moen, Shelley L HLTH:EX

Sent: Thursday, January 30, 2014 12:16 PM

To: Taylor, Mark C HLTH:EX; Hitchman, Harry J HLTH:EX
Cc: Bell, Mark J HLTH:EX

Subject: Re: It's that time again.....Station Street Property Taxes
Thanks - will do

From: Taylor, Mark C HLTH:EX

Sent: Thursday, January 30, 2014 12:13 PM Pacific Standard Time
To: Moen, Shelley L HLTH:EX; Hitchman, Harry J HLTH:EX

Cc: Bell, Mark J HLTH:EX

Subject: RE: It's that time again......

i would say there is a very high probability —so include in draft. thx

Mark C. Taylor

Director - Policy, Finance and Funding
Regional Grants and Decision Support
Ministry of Health

Phone: 250-852-1177 Fax: 250-852-1420

From: Moen, Shelley L HLTH:EX

Sent: January-30-14 12:09 PM

To: Taylor, Mark C HLTH:EX; Hitchman, Harry J HLTH:EX
Cc: Bell, Mark J HLTH:EX

Subject: Re: It's that time again......

Okay to say it is expected it will be paid this fiscal year also? We'll include Gord on sign off.

From: Taylor, Mark C HLTH:EX

Sent: Thursday, January 30, 2014 11:56 AM Pacific Standard Time
To: Hitchman, Harry J HLTH:EX; Moen, Shelley L HLUTH:EX

Cc: Bell, Mark J HLTH:EX

Subject: RE: It's that time again......

onsive

As far as | know ‘E,

Not Resp

Thanks.

Mark C. Tayior

Director - Policy, Finance and Funding
Regional Grants and Decision Support
Ministry of Health

Phone: 250-952-1177 Fax: 250-852-1420

it’s still slotted to go out this quarter.

Not Responsive
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Not Responsive

From: Hitchman, Harry J HLTH:EX

Sent: January-30-14 11:46 AM

To: Moen, Shelley L HLTH:EX

Cc: Beli, Mark J HLTH:EX; Taylor, Mark C HLTH:EX
Subject: RE: It's that time again......

Hi Shelley....kind of fike a 5" season of the year?
For 2013/14, we have not yet communicated in our funding letter that we will be funding the Station Street
property taxes. Nobody from VCHA or PHC has asked me for funding. By cc | am copying Mark Taylor to see if he

is aware of it being on the list for communication in the final funding letter.

Harry

From: Moen, Shelley L HLTH:EX
Sent: January-30-14 11:17 AM
To: Hitchman, Harry 3 HLTH:EX
Cc: Bell, Mark J HLTH:EX
Subject: It's that time again......

Sheliey Moen

Director] Capital Services Branch| Ministry of Health
Phone: 250-952-1518 Email: Shelley.Moen@gov.be.ca
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ms . MINISTRY OF HEALTH

COLUMBIA

FINANCIAL COMMUNIQUE

TO: Vancouver Coastal Health Authority
TRANSMITTAL — waR 31 20%
ATE:

COMMUNIQUE  2014-03
" NUMBER:

SUBJECT: 2013/14 Regional Health Authority Funding Allocation
Final Funding Letter

DETAILS:

s.13,8.17

MINISTRY Financial Contact
CONTACTS: Gordon Cross :

Executive Director, Regional Grants and Decision Support
250-952-1120

Program Contact

Teri Collins

Executive Director, Health Services Policy
and Quality Assurance Division

250-952-2871

M

‘@R Manjit Sidhu, CA
Assistant Deputy Minister
Finance and Corporate Services

HTH-2014-00340
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BRITISH
COLUMBIA

MAR 3 1 20% 1006897

Dr. David Ostrow -

President and Chief Executive Officer
Vancouver Coastal Health Authority
11" Floor 601 W Broadway
Vancouver BC V5Z 4C2

Dear Dr. Ostrow:

I am pleased to provide you with the Final Funding Letter for the Vancouver Coastal

Health Authority’s (VCHA) 2013/14 Regional Health Authority Funding Allocation from the
Ministry of Health. The enclosed appendices provide detail regarding the revised funding
allocation and payment schedule for VCHA.

Yours truly,

.

: Manjit Sidhu, CA

Assistant Deputy Minister
Finance and Corporate Services

Enclosures

pe: M. Glen Copping, Chief Financial Officer, VCHA
Mr. Gordon Cross, Executive Director, Regional Grants and Decision Support

Ministry of Health Office of the Assistant Deputy Minister 4-4 1513 Blanshard Street
' Finance and Corporate Services Victoria BC VW 3C§

Facsimile: 250 952-1573
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s.13,8.17

Station Street Property Taxes

s.13,8.17

2013714 Funding Letter
Final

|

800,000 |

HTH-2014-00340
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s.13,8.17

Seation Sweet Propeny Taxes | 800,000 |

s.13, .17

W14 Funding Letter
timl
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s.13,5.17

s.13,s.17

STATION STREET PROPERTY TAXES — ONE-TIME ONLY

One-time funding of $800,000 is provided to assist in the payment of the annual taxes for propeity

located on Station Street.

2013/14 Funding Letter
Final
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