Flesh, Cindy AEST:EX

-
From: Amanda van Baarsen <s 22 - >

Sent: April 7, 2019 12:41 PM

To: Parte, Maura PSA:EX

Cc: Flesh, Cindy AEST:EX

Subject: Medical note rs-22 ~

Attachments: 20190407_123007jpg RES - an\4. 43%5)

Good afternoon Maura,
1 hope you're well and enjoying your weekend.

Find attached a note from myS-22

s.22

Thank you,

Amanda
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Flesh, Cindx AEST:EX _

From: Amanda van Baarsen 522
Sent: April 10, 2019 10:07 AM
To: Parte, Maura PSAEX
Cc: Flesh, Cindy AEST:EX; Hockin, Amber PREM:EX
Subject: Re: Medical note 1522 =~
Attachments: 20190408_113727 Jpg; 20190407_123007 jpg
Follow Up Flag: Foliow up
Flag Status: Flagged
Hi Maura,
s.22
Thanks,
Amanda
s.22
On Sun., Apr. 7, 2019, 12:40 p.m. Amanda van Baarsen, wrote:

Good afternoon Maura,
! hope you're well and enjoying your weekend.

Find attached a note from$-22

s.22

Thank you,

Amanda
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Flesh, Cindz AEST:EX

From: Amanda van Baarsen <s.22 >
Sent; June 12, 2019 12:47 PM

To: Flesh, Cindy AEST:EX

Subject: Re: Medical note 1s.22

ok paid. please let me know if there was a problem.

On Wed, jun 12, 2019 at 6:07 PM Amanda van BaarsenS-22_ _ wrote:
oh! i was not aware there was still a balance.$-22

let me see if i can do a quick payments.22

On Wed., Jun. 12, 2019, 2:41 p.m. Flesh, Cindy AEST:EX, <Cindy.Flesh@gov.bc.ca> wrote:

Hello Amanda — | am hoping this okay with you ~ | have been asked to reach out to you regarding an outstanding
balance of 176.19 on your BMO travel card -s.22
s.22

Cindy Flesh

Administrative Coordinator to the

Honourable Melanie Mark

Minister of Advanced Education, Skills and Training

Telephone: 250-356-0179

** in British Columbia, the Offic of the Regntrar of Lobbyists 1s cospunsibile for inonitaring and cnforcing complionce with the Lobbyists
Regqistration Act. Ta ensure that yous ure in compliance with the 1eqistration requirements for lobbyists under the Act please cantact the Office of
the Registrar of Lobbyists at: https://www.lobbyistsregistrar.bc.co/. > *

*“Please norte: This emad messaue, mcluding ottachments, is mwended for the addressee(s) on'y and muy contain legally privileged
information. Any unautnorized use, distribution, disclosure or reproduction is strictly prohibited, If you have received this emait in
erivr, please notify sender by 1eturn email and delete all copies =~

From: Amanda van Baarsen $-22
Sent: April 10, 2019 10:07 AM
To: Parte, Maura PSA:EX <Maura.Parte@gov.bc.ca>
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Cc: Flesh, Cindy AEST:EX <Cindy.Flesh@gov.bc.ca>; Hockin, Amber PREM:EX <Amber.Hockin @gov.bc.ca>
Subject: Re: Medical note S-22

Hi Maura,

s.22

Thanks,

Amanda

On Sun., Apr. 7, 2019, 12:40 p.m. Amanda van Baarsen, 522 wrote:

Good afternoon Maura,

| hope you're well and enjoying your weekend.

Find attached a note from 522

s.22

Thank you,

Amanda
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Flesh, Cindz AEST:EX

From: Amanda van Baarsen <522
Sent: June 12, 2019 3:.08 PM
To: Flesh, Cindy AEST:EX
Subject: Re: Medical notes.22

22

oh! i was not aware there was still a balance...®
let me see if i can do a quick payment $-22
On Wed., Jun. 12, 2018, 2:41 p.m. Flesh, Cindy AEST:EX, <Cindy.Flesh@gov.bc.ca> wrote:

Hello Amanda — 1 am hoping this okay with you — | have been asked to reach out to you regarding an outstanding

balance of 176.19 on your BMO travel card -s.22
s.22

Cindy Flesh

Administrative Coordinator to the

Honourable Melanie Mark

Minister of Advanced Education, Skills and Training

Telephone: 250-356-0179

“in British Cotumbia, the Office of the Regisirar of Lobbyists is tesponsible jor momiteving and enforcing complionce with the iobbyists
Registration Act. T ensure that you are in compliance with the reqistration equirements for lobbyists under the Act please contact the ¢ Wfive of
the Registrar vf Lobbyists at: bttps: /www.lob byistsregistror.be.co/

" "Please note. This emuail inessaye, including attachments, is intended for,the addressee(s) only and may contain iegally privileged
information. Any unauthorized use, distriburion, disclosure or remroduction is strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in
erroi, please natify sender by retun email and delete alf copies.

From: Amanda van Baarsen <522

Sent: April 10, 2019 10:07 AM

To: Parte, Maura PSA:EX <Maura.Parte@gov.bc.ca>
Cc: Flesh, Cindy AEST:EX <Cindv.Flesh@gov.bc.ca>; Hockin, Amber PREM:EX <Amber.Hockin@gov.bc.ca>
Subject: Re: Medical note £-22
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