From: Nova Woodbury
To: “Christine Koch"; Noegel, Klaus AGRIXEX
Cc: "Christin i "
Subject: .17 Animal welfare receipts and PoP
Date: June 27, 2017 9:13:01 AM
Attachments: 1M 236.j

receipt_1 2017.pdf

SalesOrder 10010126.pdf
Receipts from®17
~Nova
From:s.22 :mailtos'22

Sent: June-26-17 11:30 PM

To: Nova Woodbury

Subject: Animal welfare funding
Hello Nova, I believe sending this email with the attachments I will have completed the

requirements for the incentive funding.
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From: Christine Koch

To: Noegel, Klaus AGRI:EX; "Christine Bricknell"; Nova Woodbury
Ce: Last, Gavin AGRLEX

Subject: Humane Slaughter Incentive Funding status

Date: June 29, 2017 2:21:42 PM

Attachments: HS incentive funding tracking-m r June 26, 2017 .xlsx

Good afternoon,
I've attached the Humane Slaughter Incentive Funding program summary status report as of

Monday, June 26.5.17
s.17

Nova sent out a short notice to all program applicants on Tuesday saying the program was ending
August 31, 2017 and that all invoices and proof of payments must be submitted by August 15. She
also stated that this will be the final deadline, and that the program will not be extended beyond
that date.

We hope this inspires some more action!

Regards,

Christine

Christine Koch, MISP Program Manager

BC Food Processors Association www.bcfpa.ca koch.c@telus.net
202B — 8047 — 199" Street, Langley, BC V2V OE2. ¢ 604-866-7600
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Fier 517

H516-006

HS516-028

H316-003

H516-009

H516-010
H516-002

H516-012
H516-15
H516-007
H516-005

H516-004

H516-008

H516-042

H516-013
H316-011

training date of
location AW :' di : pp! I |irwoioes ‘I
GAP |reguesl | Lgroof
Abbottsford not participating furthe
Nanaimo Now 8 Nov 17
N a June 8 Nov 14 Nov 14 Mar 10
Vernon July 29 April 24 April 24
Castlegar
Castlegar Aug 18 Dec 12
Castlegar Now BC Meats
Duncan Sept 7 Mot planning on o ting this year
Prince George |Feb & IFEI:I 16
Duncan Dec 9 Mar 21 |Dec 15 | |
Now called Copper Mtn
Mov 4 &
Prince George |Oct 1% May 1 May 1
Cranbrook Aug 17 Feb 20 Mov 7 Mar 10
Cranbraok Mar 22 Sept 22 Mar 30
Video & Nova |May 16 |April 26 April 26
June 20 &
Abbottsford Nov 23 May 16 May 20 [June 20 |July 15
Cranbrook will not be moving forward with an abattoir |
Cranbrook Mow called East Kooteny Poultry
Video & Mova _|June 22 |April 27 April 27
Dec 31
Duncan Dec 21 Jan 3 Jan 3
Jan 23 &
Cranbroak Jan 16 May 1 May 1
Cranbrook Mot moving forward with abattoir at this time
June 13 &
Cranbrook Nov 3 Not moving ferward with Class A licen
Cranbraok May 1
Cranbrook June 16 |April 12
Dec 31
N a Dec 20 April 12 lan 3
Cranbrook June 17 |Sept 27 Sept 27
Abbottsford Jan 1% Feb 3
Kamloops June 20 |June 20 July & Sept 22 |Sept 22
Prince Gearge [Oct 17 Mar 15 Nov 4
Vernon July 21 Oct 3 Oct 3 Sept 26 |Sept 26
Duncan Sept 7 Sept 22 Sept 22 Mar 10
Dawson Creek |April 6 April 6 April 6
Abbottsford Mar 15 Feb 12 Feb 14 Mar 17 Mar 17
Vernon July 21 July 26 July 27 Aug 15 Aug 15
Vernon July 25 Sept 12 Sept 12
June 16 &
Vernan Aug B Mov 7 June 17 [lune 16 |lune 20
Abbottsford Jan 17 April 26 April 26
Prince George |Oct 24 March 14
Mow called Arenbrook
Duncan Aug 5 Aug 16 Aug 12 Aug 17 Aug 16
Castlegar Aug 18 Dee 12 MNow BC Meats
Dawson Creek |April 3 April 3 April 5
Mov 15 &
N a Mov 10 |April 24 April 24
Kamloops Oct 25 MNov 12 Mov 14
Kamloops Sept 29  |Oct 3
Feb & & Mar
Video & Nova _|Jan 27 30 rev Feb &
Kaml Qct 21 MNov 4
Cranbraok Aug 19 Feb 26 Feb 3 Mar 10
Kaml June 12 |April 12 April 12
Sept 29, Dec
Aug 4 rev |29 & April
Duncan Sept 7 17 Mar 10
Vernan July 7

Prince George

now called Robson Valley |

s.17

Item

poultry and rabbits

on approval of license

Do we have their funding application an file?

poultry and rabbits-needs one maore follow-up visit after construction finished-done

zephyr gun and water bath-poultry and rabbits

Are re-considering moving forward as a Class A

application on hold ding license & AW 1t

Knock Box and waiting area for the animals

rebuilt & covered corral system, automatic watering system

stun gun

electric stunning knife for poultry

holding pen, water trough, fly zapper/spray

Covered dock area

cages for transport & improvements to their pen and corral system

electric stunning knife

< 17 < Qant proceeding with rabbits

o 1 7 started processing sheep

d before and after pictures for improvements

Fabrication & installation of pen division gates

1,760.00 8,564.43 Dpd pd remaining

1,637.95

2,104.00
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517

H316-001

Total

[pawson Creek Japrils  Japriis | [ [ 517
Dawson Creek |April 4 I-ﬂpril 4 I-ﬂpril 5 | ]
|Kamloops Dropped out of program
Nanaimo Dec 18 IApriI 12 IDec 30/31
|video & Nova [Feb10  [mars |Feb 16 | I
Castlegar Not applicable
|Castlegar Junels |Aug2 Aug 5
N imo Nov 8 Mar 30 Nov 15
|Prince George |Oct 25 Mar 15 Mar 16
Vernan Sept 29 Sept 29 April 17
|Cranbrook now doing business as Columbia Valley Meat & Sa
Prince George |Oct 18 pended license
Feb 16 &
Video & Nova |Feb 3 May 1 May 1

334,500

78,315.80

may be adding poultry and rabbits§ | 1 ?

sack-up stunner for turkeys

“abbit project [separate from main HS praject)
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From: Nova Woodbury

To: Noegel, Klaus AGRLEXS-22
Ce: "Christine Bricknell"
Subject: s.17 invoices to date, humane slaughter BC32
Date: July 17, 2017 3:36:42 PM
Attachments: 1 sleggs.PDE
canadian tire.PDE
: P
1TG Enterprises.PDF
Lowes Homehardware.PDF
Princess Auto Slegg.PDF
princess auto.PDF
r ral store PDF

And here are the receipts and proof of purchase.
~Nova

FromS-17

Sent: June-24-17 4:28 PM

To: 'Nova Woodbury'

Subject: invoices to date, humane slaughter BC32

Here are attached files of invoices to date.
s.22

BC32
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From: Christine Koch

To: “Nova Woodbury"; Noegel, Klaus AGRI:EX

Cc: "Christin i 1"

Subject: RE: (8.17 Construction project photos, funding reconciliation, june 24 2017 update
Date: July 24, 2017 9:08:34 AM

Looks great; a good use of their potentials.17  incentive funding.

----- Original Message-----

From: Nova Woodbury [maj_ljss 22

Sent: July-17-17 3:35 PM

To: 'Noegel, Klaus AGRI:EX' 4KlauS‘Noegel@gov.bc‘ca>5-22

Cc: 'Christine Bricknell' <christine(@square-one.ca>

Subjectis 17 _ . Construction project photos, funding
reconciliation, june 24 2017 update

I had a look at this while T was on Saturna last week and it looks great.
They almost doubled their kill floor space by putting in a proper stunning
and sticking area. Klaus, you may not be aware of how they previously
stunned, but I will be more than happy to fill you in.

~Nova

----- Original Message-----

From:s.17

Sent: June-24-17 4:27 PM

To: 'Nova Woodbury'

Subject: Emailing: Construction project photos, funding reconciliation, june
24 2017 update

Here is an update of where we are on the "Humane Slaughter" funding
request.

To date I have been unable to get the electrician to give an estimate or do
the work required for the project. I expect that will be coming soon.

I have ordered the winch and hopefully it will arrive next week with
appropriate accessories.

I will have one labour bill for about 8 to 10 hours. We needed some extra
help when moving heavy beams and the roof.

We will be picking up a step stool for the shooter of the beef.

I expect that I will be fabricating the head lift.

I have been unable to locate a suitable pistol grip gun, but at this point
will wait until all other items are finished. (I do have a cylindrical type
gun which we use now as well as a spare one.

The roof is on and we were able to use the space for the lamb slaughter
yesterday. We still need to complete gates that will be permanent fixtures.

s.22

Ps sending invoices on separate email.

Your message is ready to be sent with the following file or link
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attachments:

Construction project photos
funding reconciliation
june 24 2017 update

Note: To protect against computer viruses, e-mail programs may prevent
sending or receiving certain types of file attachments. Check your e-mail
security settings to determine how attachments are handled.
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File #

Tahattair

517

H516-008
H516-006

H516-028
H516-017

H516-003

H516-055

H516-037

H516-009

H516-036
H516-010
H516-041
H516-002
H516-020
H516-012
H516-015

H516-044
H516-007
H516-005

H516-004
H516-023

H516-008
H516-

H516-025
H516-019

s.17

]training date of
location AW |fur|ding |approval |irwnlces |payment
GAP Irequest [pmnf
Abbottsford not participating further
Nanaimo Nov 9 MNov 17
Nanaimo June 8 Nov 14 Nov 14 Mar 10
Vernon July 29 April 24 April 24
Castlegar
Castlegar Aug 18 Dec 12
Castlegar Now BC Meats
Duncan Sept 7 Not planning on operating this year
Prince George |Feb B |Feb 16
Duncan Dec 9 Mar 21 IDec 15 ] [
Now called Copper Mtn
Nov 4 &
Prince George |Oct 19 May 1 May 1
Cranbrook Aug 17 Feb 20 Mov 7 Mar 10
Cranbrook Mar 22 Sept 22 Mar 30
Video & Nova |May 16 April 26 April 26
June 20 &
Abbottsford Mov 23 May 16 May 20 June 20 [July 15
Cranbrook will not be moving forward with an abattoir
Cranbrook Now called East Kooteny Poultry
Video & Nova [June 22 |April 27 April 27
Dec 31 Jan
Duncan Dec21 Jan 3 3
lan 23 &
Cranbrook Jan 16 May 1 May 1
Cranbrook Not moving forward with abattoir at this time
June 13 &
Cranbrook Nov 3 Not moving forward with Class A licel
Cranbrook May 1
Cranbrook June 16 |April 12
Dec 31 Jan
Manaimo Dec 20 April 12 3
Cranbrook June 17 |Sept 27 Sept 27
Abbottsford Jan 19 Feb 3
Kamloops June 20 |lune 20 July 6 Sept 22 |Sept 22
Prince George |Oct 17 Mar 15 Mov 4
Vernon July 21 Oct 3 Oct 3 Sept 26 Sept 26
Duncan Sept 7 Sept 22 Sept 22 Mar 10
Dawson Creek |April 6 April 6 April 6
Abbottsford Mar 15 Feb 12 Feb 14 Mar 17 Mar 17
Vernon July 21 July 26 July 27 Aug 15 Aug 15
Vernon July 25 Sept 12 Sept 12
June 16 &
Vernon Aug 8 Mov 7 June 17 June 16 |June 20
Abbottsford Jan 17 April 26 April 26
Prince George |Oct 24 March 14
Now called Arenbrook
Duncan Aug 5 Aug 16 Aug 12 ]Aug 17 [Aug 16
Castlegar Aug 18 Dec 12 MNow BC Meats
Dawson Creek |April 3 April 3 April 5
Nov 15 &
Manaimo Mov 10 April 24 April 24
Kamloops Oct 29 Nov 12 Nov 14
Kamloops Sept 29 Oct 3
Feb & & Mar
Video & Nova [Jan 27 30 rev Feb 6

Item

poultry and rabbits

E ded to end of Sept, but must have license in place to trigger pay

on approval of license

o

|Do we have their fi g application on file?

poultry and rabbits-needs one more follow-up visit after construction finished-done

zephyr gun and water bath-poultry and rabbits

Are re-considering moving forward as a Class A

application on hold pending license & AW assessment

Knock Box and waiting area for the animals

rebuilt & covered corral system, automatic watering system

stun gun

electric stunning knife for poultry

|E ded to October 1, 2017 for knock box

holding pen, water trough, fly zapper/spray

Covered dock area

cages for transport & improvements to their pen and corral system

electric stunning knife

Remain af§ | 1 ? 10t proceeding with rabbits
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{amloops Oct 21 Mov 4 51 ?
H516-042 Cranbrook Aug 19 Feb 26 Feb 3 Mar 10
{amloops June 12 |April 12 April 12
Sept 29, Dec
Aug 4 rev |29 & April
H516-013 Duncan Sept 7 17 Mar 10
H516-011 vernon July 7
Prince George now called Robson Valley
Dawson Creek |April 5 IApriI 5 I ] [
Dawson Creek |Aprild  [April 4 [aprils | |
<amloops Dropped out of program
H516-035 Nanaimo Dec19  [April12  [Dec30/31] |
video & Nova |Feb 10 IMarB IFeb 16 ] [
HS16-001 Castlegar Not applicable
Castlegar June 15 JAug 2 Aug 5
Nanaimo Nov & Mar 30 Nov 15
H516-024 ?rince George |Oct 25 Mar 15 Mar 16
vernon Sept 29 Sept 29 April 17
Cranbrook now doing business as Columbia Valley Meat & Sau
Prince George |Oct 18 suspended license
Feb 16 & ‘ ‘
H516-046 Video & Nova |Feh 9 May 1 May 1
Total 334,500

121,475.92

increased 105, 1 7 - started processing sheep

requested before and after pictures for improvements

Fabrication & installation of pen division gates

may be adding poultry and rabbitss 1 ?

back-up stunner for turkeys

rahbit project (separate from main HS project)

1,637.95 2,104.00 2,023.06
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From: Nova Woodbury

To: Noegel, Klaus AGRI:EX; "Christine Koch"
Cc: "Christine Bricknell"

Subject: s.17 AW Expenses and PoP
Date: August 3, 2017 4:42:59 PM
Attachments: 5.17 Hydraulic Receipt.pdf

Hydraulic PoP.pdf

Attached is an AW purchase made bys.17
Nova Woodbury

Executive Director

BC Association of Abattoirs
250-379-2881
250-558-6855 (cell)
http://bcabattoirs.org/

http://bcmeats.ca/
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From: Nova Woodbury

To: "Christine Bricknell"
Ce: Noegel. Klaus AGBIEstz .17
Subject: s.17 Humane Slaughter request tor tunding
Date: August 7, 2017 1:11:28 PM
Attachments: lectrical r invoice.pdf

labour slaughter house holding pens.pdf

request for funding humane.pdf

inch

Please find attached receipts etc. from® 17 Christine B., could you please give her
an update on the status of her cheques.

Thanks!

Nova

---------- Forwarded message ----------

From: s-17

Date: Mon, Aug 7, 2017 at 12:20 PM

Subject: Humane Slaughter request for funding

To: Nova Woodbury <nova.woodbury(@bcmeats.ca>

This is in addition to the two email that I sent on June 24, 2017.

This will be final request, I never heard anything after the two emails sent on June 24, and
have received no cheques.

My electrical came in much higher than anticipated as I did not take into consideration the
need to protect wires from livestock and make everything water proof.

5.22

Page 22 0f40 AGR-2020-01157



Page 23 of 40 to/a Page 24 of 40
Withheld pursuant to/removed as

s.17;s.21;s.22



O oo dOYUn B WNRER X

=
(=]

s.17

Request for funding for upgrades to BC 32 for safe and humane animal handling.
Construction of a new holding pen and space for kill box.
Estimated
Description s.17
cement foundation and floor
roofing and screws
hardware for construction
electric wiring and fixtures
water line and troughs
fabricating head lift
electric pressure washer
electric winch and cables
captive bolt pistol gun
labour

TOTAL

s.17

s.17 Originally |

did not plan to hire labour, but
there were some days with extra
heavy lifting that | did hire for 10
hours. | grossly miscalculated
the electrical. This is mostly due
to the fact that | did not take into
consideration that everything
had to be water proof and well
protected from the livestock.
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From: Christine Koch

To: "Nova Woodbury";

Cc: "Christine Bricknell"S.22

Subject: RE:'5.17 - Purchase of electric stunner for pigs
Date: August 8, 2017 4:29:09 PM

Sounds like a good idea to me.

From: Nova Woodbury [mailtos.22
Sent: August-06-17 8:15 AM
To: 'Noegel, Klaus AGRI:EX'S-22
Cc: 'Christine Bricknell' ; .22
Subject:5-17 - Purchase of electric stunner for pigs
Importance: High
Good morning,
s.17 would like to purchase an electric hog stunner with their funding. When | did the
assessment last year, they weren't processing many pigs, and as per Anne's email below, apparently
their current crew is having trouble stunning with the captive bolt.
Please lets.22 (and me) know if you are ok with the purchase of the electric hog stunner.
Thank-you.
~Nova
From$S.22
Sent: August-06-17 6:24 AM
To: Nova Woodbury
Subject: Purchase of electric stunner for pigs
Importance: High
Hi Nova
Hoping you can answer this immediately
| have just realized an electric stunner for pigs wasn’t specifically mentioned in the original
recommendations for BC 41.
However up to $3000 was approved for hogs so | am assuming it will be eligible for funding. We are
purchasing an electric stunner ( our current crew are not able to use the captive bolt effectively) and
| need to know if a refund will be approved when | submit the invoice.
Thanks
s.22
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From: Christine Koch

To: Noegel, Klaus AGRI:EX; Nova Woodbury; “Christine Bricknell”
Subject: Updated Humane Slaughter status

Date: August 10, 2017 11:06:50 AM

Attachments: HS incentive funding tracking-m r A 2017 .xlsx

Good morning,

Please find attached the current master tacking table for the humane slaughter incentive program. |
added a new column to better track the payouts.

We're now in the last month; other than two exceptions. To date we've approvecs.17 n
projects and paid out $-17 Almost half way. We budgeteds-17 or incentive funding, so it
looks like we’ll be pretty close to the budgeted amount.

Christine B will be busy the next few weeks!

Regards, Christine

Christine

Christine Koch, MISP Program Manager

BC Food Processors Association www,bcfga.ca's-22

202B — 8047 — 199" Street, Langley, BCV2V 0E2. c 604-866-7600
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File #

H516-008
H516-006

H516-034

H516-028
H516-017

H516-003

H516-055

H516-005

H516-036
H516-010

H516-037
H516-041
H516-002
H516-020
H516-012
H516-015

H516-044
H516-007
H516-005

H516-004

H516-040
H516-023

H516-008
H516-

H516-025
H516-019

| Abattair

s.17

date of I
location AW I' ling PR I [imroices ! 51 7
GAP  |request [ |proof Amount
Abbottsford not participating further
Manaimo Mov 9 MNov 17 2,000
Nanaimo June 8 Mov 14 Mov 14 Mar 10 2,000
Vernon July 29 April 24 April 24 4,000
Castlegar 4,000
Castlegar Aug 18 Dec 12 2,000
Castlegar Mow BC Meats
Duncan Sept 7 Mot planning on operating this year 4,000
Prince George |Feb & Feb 16 I 13,000
Duncan Dec 9 Mar 21 |Dec 15 | 6,000
MNow called Copper Mtn
Mov 4 &
Prince George |[Oct 19 May 1 May 1 11,000
Cranbrook Aug 17 Feb 20 Mov 7 Mar 10 4,000
Cranbrook Mar 22 Sept 22 Mar 30 4,000
Video & Nova |May 16 April 26 April 26 2,000
June 20 &
Abbottsford Moy 23 May 16 May 20 June 20 |July 15 4,000
Cranbrook will not be moving forward with an abattoir
Cranbrook Now called East Kooteny Poultry
Video & Nova  |lune 22 |April 27 April 27 2,000
Jan23 &
Cranbrook Jan 16 May 1 May 1 2,000
Cranbrook Not moving forward with abattoir at this time
June 13 & ‘
Cranbrook Mov 3 Mot moving forward with Class A license
Cranbrook May 1
Cranbrook June 16 |April 12 9,000
Dec 31 Jan
Manaimo Dec 20 April 12 3 11,000
Cranbrook June 17 |Sept 27 Sept 27 9,000
Dec 31 Jan
Duncan Dec 21 Jan 3 3 2,000
Ahbottsford Jan 19 Feb 3 5,000
Kamloops June 20 June 20 July 6 Sept 22 Sept 22 9,000
Prince George [Oct 17 Mar 15 MNov 4 9,000
Vernon July 21 Oct 3 Oct 3 Sept 26 |Sept 26 3,000
Duncan Sept 7 Sept 22 Sept 22 Mar 10 4,000
Dawson Creek | April 6 April 6 April 6 9,000
Abbottsford Mar 15 Feb12 Feb 14 Mar 17 Mar 17 2,000
Vernon July 21 July 26 July 27 Aug 15 Aug 15 3,000
Vernon July 25 Sept 12 Sept 12 2,000
June 16 &
Vernon Aug 8 MNov 7 June 17 |June 16 |June 20 11,000
Abbottsford Jan 17 April 26 April 26 6,000
Prince George |Oct 24 March 14 4,000
Video & Nova  [July 25 July 25 Aug 1 2,000
Now called Arenbrook
Duncan Augs Aug 16 Aug1?  [Aug17  |Augil6 5,000
Castlegar Aug 18 Dec 12 Mow BC Meats 2,000
Dawson Creek |April 3 April 3 April 5 2,000
Nov 15 &
MNanaimo Moy 10 April 24 April 24 11,000
Kamloops Oct 29 Moy 12 Moy 14 2,000
Kamloops Sept29  |Oct3 11,000
Feb & & Mar
Video & Nova _|Jan 27 30 rev Feb & 9,000

poultry and rabbits

on approval of license

Do we have their funding application on file?

zephyr gun and water bath-poultry and rabbits

| Are re-considering moving forward as a Class A
application on hold pending license & AW assessment

Knock Box and waiting area for the animals

rebuilt & covered corral system, automatic watering system

stun gun
electric stun nini knife for poulti

holding pen, water trough, fly zapper/spray
Covered dock area

cages for transoort & imorovements to their pen and corral system

s.17

electric stunning knife

Remain at§ | 1 7 not proceeding with rabbits

poultry and rabbits-needs one more follow-up visit after construction finished-done

Page 29 of 40 AGR-2020-01157



s.17

H516-042
H516-053

H516-013
H516-011

H516-048
H516-051

H516-035

H516-001

H516-024

HS16-046
Total

Kamloops Oct 21 MNov 4
Cranbrook Aug 19 Feb 26 Feb 3 Mar 10
Kamloops June 12 |April 12 April 12
Sept 29, Dec
Aug drev |29 & April
Duncan Sept 7 17 Mar 10
Vernon July 7
Prince George now called Robson Valle
Dawson Creek | April 5 |Apri| 5 I
Dawson Creek |April4  |April 4 |April 5 | |
Kamloops Dropped out of program
Nanaimo Dec 19 |Apri| 12 |Dec 30/31 | |
video & Nova  |Feb 10 |Mar 8 [Feb16 | |
Castlegar Not licabl
Castlegar June 15 Aug 2 Aug 5
Nanaimo Nov 8 Mar 30 MNov 15
Prince George |Oct 25 Mar 15 Mar 16
Vernon Sept 29 |Sept 29 April 17
Cranbrook now doing b as Columbia Valley Meat & Sau
Prince George |Oct 18 suspended license
Feb 16 & ‘
Video & Nova |Feb 9 May 1 May 1

s.17

increased 15 | 1 ? - started processing sheep

requested before and after pictures for improvements

Fabrication & installation of pen division gates

may be adding poultry and rabbits; cap would then beg i 1 ?

back-up stunner for turkeys

rabbit project (separate from main HS project)

1,637.95 2,104.00  2,013.06
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From: Nova Woodbury

To: "Christine Bricknell"
Ce: “Christine Koch"; Noegel. Klaus AGRI:EX
Subject: Somerset AW Wage paid
Date: August 15, 2017 11:17:14 AM
Attachments: IMG_2833.JP

ATTO0702.txt

Here is a photo out of the cheque for wages.

~Nova

--—-Original Message-----
FromS.22

Sent: August-14-17 4:32 PM
To: Nova Woodbury
Subject: Wage paid

This is a pic of the cheque paid out for building the chute to the knocking
box
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From: Christine Bricknell

To: "Nova Woodbury"
Cc: "Christine Koch"; Noegel, Klaus AGRI:EX
Subject: RES.17 "Receipt Captive Bolt
Date: August 15, 2017 12:03:11 PM
Attachments: im 1.

im 2.
Nova,

When we cannot get proof of payment and exchange rate we use a trusted foreign exchange rate
Oanda.com to get the historical rate for that day.

Regards,

Christine Bricknell, Accountant

BC Food Processors Association www.bcfpa.ca
Office: (604) 371-4245 Cell: (604) 2171471

Direct Line: (604) 855-4745

From: Nova Woodbury [mailto$-22

Sent: Tuesday, August 15,2017 11:16 AM

To: 'Christine Bricknell'

Cec: 'Christine Koch'; 'Noegel, Klaus AGRLEX'
Subject: 5 17 Receipt Captive Bolt

Below is the receipt for a captive bolt stunner for Somerset on Gabriola Island. The
purchase was made on thes.22 and the person I am dealing with is
$.22 She told me she doesn't have access to his statement, so is unsure
what the exchange rate used was or if there were additional credit card charges. Klaus,
I'm sure you know the story!
So, I asked her if it is ok to use the exchange rate according to
http://fx.s: ~.ubc.ce ay.html on the date of transaction which was
would make the amount $s.17 Canadian. She is ok with this.
From:s.22
Sent: July-30-17 2:08 PM

To: Nova Woodbury
Subject: Fwd: Transaction Receipt from ACCLES & SHELVOKE INC for s.17 (USD)

Here is the receipt for the stunner. It shows the date of purchase
Thanks
$.22

s.17 so this

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Auto-Receipt" <noreply(@mail.authorize.net>

Date: July 28, 2017 at 4:27:00 PM PDT

To: "Eric Boulton" <s.22

Subject: Transaction Receipt from ACCLES & SHELVOKE
INC for s-17

Reply-To: "Katy Turner" <k rner(@acclesandshelvok k>

s.17
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s.17;8.21; 8.22
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From: Nova Woodbury

To: Noegel, Klaus AGRI:EX

Cc: "Christine Bricknell"; "Christine Koch"

Subject: FW: BC 41 Humane Slaughter Incentive Program
Date: August 15, 2017 4:20:04 PM

Hi,

As pe5'22 email below, she would like to have an extension. If the contractor isn't available until
the end of August, | suggest we give them until the end of September to get us all the
receipts...contractors are always behind schedule.

~Nova
.5.22

From:
Sent: August-15-17 4:00 PM
To: Nova Woodbury
Cc: christine@bcfpa.ca
Subject: BC 41 Humane Slaughter Incentive Program
Thes.17 would like to request an extension if possible.
We haveS-17  -emaining unspent which we had hoped to put towards a wooden insert in our
knock box to restrain pigs and lambs. Unfortunately the contractor who is working on this for us is
unable to do the work before the end of August.
The estimate is $.17  for labour and materials.
Please let me know if it is possible to approve an extension preferably until mid September.
Thank you

s.17
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From: Christine Koch

To: Noegel, Klaus AGRI:EX

Subject: RE:s 17  may need an extension
Date: August 17, 2017 1:43:43 PM
Thanks!

-----Original Message-----

From: Noegel, Klaus AGRL:EX [mailto:Klaus.Noegel(@gov.be.cal
Sent: August-17-17 1:33 PM

To: Christine Koch <5.22

Subject: Re:s.17 may need an extension

Granted

Klaus H. Noegel
A/Operations Manager BC Meat Inspection Program Ministry of Agriculture

Sent from my iPhone

> On Aug 17, 2017, at 1:32 PM, Christine Kochs.22 wrote:
=

> Do you agree to an extension for them?

=

> Sorry, but both of us need to support the extension.

=

> -----Original Message-----

> From: Christine Koch [];]_milm_;s-22

> Sent: August-16-17 12:19 PM

> To: 'Nova Woodbury' 5 22 Noegel, Klaus AGRL:EEX'
> <Klaus.Noegel(@gov.bc.ca>; 'Christine Bricknell'

> <christine(@square-one.ca>

> Subject: RE:5.17 may need an extension

=

> Given their current circumstances and that they were late to program,
> [ approve an extension to the end of September, but no further.

=

> Klaus, do you agree?

=

> -----Original Message-----

> From: Nova Woodbury [mailtcS.22

> Sent: August-15-17 4:27 PM

> To: 'Noegel, Klaus AGRI:EEX' <Klaus.Noegel@gov.bc.ca>; 'Christine

Bricknell'

> <christine@square-one.ca>; 'Christine Koch' 5.22
> Subject: FWg 22 may need an extension

=

s.17

will need an extension. The person they need to build the
> rest of the knocking box won't be able to work on it until early

> September. So they need and extension until the end of September.
=

> ~Nova

=

=

> -----Original Message-----
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> From: Nova Woodbury [mailtns-22

> Sent: August-15-17 11:20 AM

> To: 'Noegel, Klaus AGRI:EX"; 'Christine Koch'; 'Christine Bricknell'
> Subject:s.17 may need an extension

=

> [ will be speaking t3-22  Jater today, but based on the email below,
> she hasn't been able to get all her purchases made by the deadline.

> This plant is in dire need of the improvements, so once I have spoken

> to her, I will let you know when she expects to get everything in place.

>
> ~Nova

>

>

> -----Original Message-----
> From:$.22

> Sent: August-14-17 4:40 PM
> To: Nova Woodbury

> Subject: Squeeze

-

> We have been working on ordering our squeeze for the last month. The

> person we dealt with has been inconsistent in dealing with us. Was
> supposed to deliver the equipment on the weekend and get paid by

> cheque but she backed out of delivery can we photograph cheque as
> document and submit it? We still anticipate delivery in the next

> couple weekss.22

=

> Sent from my iPhone

=
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s.22

From:

To: Noegel. Klaus AGRI:EX; "Christine Koch"; "Christine Bricknell”
Subject: s5.17 new owners and AW funding

Date: January 8, 2018 1:49:16 PM

| know the animal welfare funding is finished, but we were a bit under the target on expenditures, so
| thought | would see if the new owners ofS$-17 in Duncan would receive fundings.22  and

s.22 took the training, but did not to go ahead with my recommendations since they
decided to shut down. The new owners (and animals) would benefit from some improvements.
So, if I sent them the training video and material, is there any possible way we could provide some
off-set funding for a new captive bolt stun gun, a Zephyr and a new knock box?
Never hurts to ask ©
Nova Woodbury

Executive Director

BC Association of Abattoirs
250-379-2881
250-558-6855 (cell)
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