From: Farrance, Melissa EDUC:EX

To: Hahn, Andra EDUC:EX

Subject: FW: Jan. 15 - Melissa"s credit card - National Rental Agreement §.17.5.
Date: Wednesday, January 24, 2018 4:17:57 PM

Attachments: National Rental Agreement g 17 5. .pdf

From: Hahn, Andra EDUC:EX

Sent: Thursday, January 18, 2018 2:45 PM

To: Farrance, Melissa EDUC:EX

Subject: FW: Jan. 15 - Melissa's credit card - National Rental Agreement 5.17,5.22

From: Customerservice@nationalcar.com [mailto:Customerservice@nationalcar.com]
Sent: Monday, January 15, 2018 3:14 PM

To: Hahn, Andra EDUC:EX
Subject: Jan. 15 - Melissa's credit card - National Rental Agreement s.17,5.22

X National.

Per your request, please see the attached PDF document for the Invoice Details.

Terms | Privacy Policy

© 2018 Enterprise Rent A Car 600 Corporate Park Drive St. Louis MO 63105

Page 1 of 1 EDU-2018-87015



