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F521EXESLP43

—t * Ministry of Finance RETURN CHEQUE TO MINISTRY?
U85 Where ideas work INVOICE CODING SHEET (if yes, enter “D")
FOREIGN CURRENCY OR WIRE?
a lnstructions. (if yes, enter “$” for foreign and
“W" for Wire transfer)

PAYEE NAME BOB DEWAR CONSULTING * SUPPLIER # NR _*SITE 001

CONTRACT/PO # _C20PREM1529 INVOICEDATE  30-NOV-2020 _ INVOICE # NR
DO-MMM-YYYY
NTE |NV°‘E 01-DEC-2020
RECEIVED 12-)AN-2020 DATE GOODS/ SERVICES REC'D 30-NOV-2020 RECEIPT # m
DD-MMM-YYYY DO-MMM-YYYY
NAME &/OR ADDRESS OVERRIDE: DESCRIPTION FOR CHEQUE STUB:
Bob Dewar Consulting
22 ‘ .
DATE CHQ/EFT REQ'D _
{ONLY IF URGENT) GL DATE (if applicable) PAY ALONE? YES [X]
AN 7Y DO-MMM-YYYY
OFA STOB & ASSET # (if applicable) : o R
PRE-TAX NAME &
AMOUNT pST GST TAX CODE SERVICE
AMOUNT pracsmonerar | CL | RESP sTOB | PROJECT | SUPPLEER#if
ONCLUDING TAX) | 0 NG TAX) AMOUNT AMOUNT 8%, &1, P LINE ST0857
14,437.50 13,750.00 687.50 004 | 36A10 | 36200 | 6101 | 3600000
14437.50 | TOTAL
* EXPENSE AUTHORITY (EA) INFORMATION: * QUALIFIED RECEIVER (QR) CERTIFICATION:
» VANESSA GEARY . ELIZABETH PARKINSON
EA PRINTED NAME QR PRINTED NAME
The goods provided of services del d have been inspected of d: and the goods of services wers
* BRIEF PAYMENT DESCRIPTION FOR EA NOTIFICATION: properly received and documantation to support the account has been varified (L., goods: i ordared,
Note: This Is also the line description displayed on GL detail reports. mﬂ wn:?;:;*ﬂw'g:::*;rxfd appropriate blas and/or perf
_ « O g L Pav
T—— QR SIGNATURE

ADDITIONAL INFORMATION OR INSTRUCTIONS:

* Note: Fields with an asterisk do not need to be completed for \Procurement invoices
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Bob Dewar CONSULTING

s.22

|NVO|CE Vanessa Geary, Office of the Premier
Suite 740-999 Canada Place
Vancouver, B.C V6C 3E1

Date: 2020-12-01

Invoice NumberNR

November 9" to November 27" 3 weeks $12,750
@54,250 per week
$1,000
November 6" 1 day at $1,000 per day
Subtotal $13,750.00
GST 5.00% $687.50
Total $14,437.50
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Detailed work:

November 9% to 27t - Worked in Victoria West Annex on various files including transition
conducted meetings with MLAs and Premier and political staff. 3 weeks

November 6" - Worked in Victoria East Annex on transition files. 1 day
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Parkinson, Elizabeth PREM:EX

From: Geary, Vanessa PREM:EX
Sent: December 1, 2020 10:36 AM
To: Parkinson, Elizabeth PREM:EX
Subject: FW: November invoice
Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Bob’s invoice is approved with the correction that work was done out of the “West” Annex as opposed to the East
Annex. Thanks Vanessa

From: Meggs, Geoff PREM:EX <Geoff.Meggs@gov.bc.ca>

Sent: December 1, 2020 10:34 AM

To: Geary, Vanessa PREM:EX <Vanessa.Geary@gov.bc.ca>
Subject: Re: November invoice

They look fine but he says East Annex - think he means West

G

Sent from my iPhone

On Dec 1, 2020, at 10:27 AM, Geary, Vanessa PREM:EX <Vanessa.Geary@gov.bc.ca> wrote:

Please review and confirm. Thanks V

From: Bob Dewar s.22

Sent: December 1, 2020 7:53 AM

To: Parkinson, Elizabeth PREM:EX <Elizabeth.Parkinson@gov.bc.ca>
Cc: Geary, Vanessa PREM:EX <Vanessa.Geary@gov.bc.ca>

Subject: November invoice

This email came from an external source. Only open attachments or
links that you are expecting from a known sender. i |

Hi Elizabeth,

Enclosed is my invoice for November 2020.
Thanks,

Bob

<Detailed work November 2020.docx>
<Executive Council - Invoice NR November 2020.docx>
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FSZIEXESLP33

oz Ministry of Finance RETURN CHEQUE TO MINISSTRY?
.= Where ideas work INVOICE CODING SHEET ( yes, enter D)
FOREIGN CURRENCY OR WIRE?
ik to inwpece Coding Sheet completion mstructions m mm' -
PAYEENAME _BOB DEWAR CONSULTING “suppLER® R *sme oo |
CONTRACT/PO# C20PREM1529 INVOICE DATE ~ 05-JAN-2021  INVOICES NR 5
DATE INVOICE
RECEIVED 05-JAN-2021 DATE GOODS/ SERVICES REC'D 18-DEC-2020  RECEWPTS m}_ & |
DO-MM Y i S0 ama vreY i |
NAME &/OR ADDRESS OVERRIDE: | DESCRIPTION FOR CHEQUE STUB: - i
Bob Dewar Consuiting '
8.22 :
DATE CHQ/EFT REQ'D
ONLY iF URGENT GL DATE (if applicable) PAY ALONE? vEs [
OFA STOB & ASSET # ¥ agpicabie
PRE-TAX " [T
AMOUNT psT GST TAX CODE sRvcE
(INCLUDING TAX) WMIM | AMOUNT AMOUNT e L..:.:.u;'r - | c RESP i STO8 | PROSECT SUPPLER 8 if
6,667.50 6,350.00 .r 31750 | 004 | 38A10 36200 | 6101 | 3600000
r
|
] |
! .
: i
|
| =
' :
1 1 |
6667.50 | TOTAL
* EXPENSE AUTHORITY (EA) INFORMATION: * QUALIFIED RECEIVER (QR) CERTIFICATION:
" VANESSA GEARY “ ELIZABETH PARKINSON
EA PRINTED NAME QF PRINTED NAME

* BRIEF PAYMENT DESCRIPTION FOR EA NOTIFICATION:
Note: This is also the line description displayed on GL detail reports.

4

n-paupmrm:nuw“w“r“m }
FOSET MRSRES BAT SocuTertIton 1D SUDPON the SCSOURt has Deen verfied (L. guod atertered,
correct A sttt ATy wevTes B

C ™y vt bees met)

QR SIGNATURE

ADDITIONAL INFORMATION OR INSTRUCTIONS:

* Note: Fields with an astenisk 30 not need to be compileted for Procy
FIN FSA 017 REV. OCT/26

rement invoces

Audited 2021fanl2
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Parkinson, Elizabeth PREM:EX

From: Meggs, Geoff PREM:EX

Sent: January 6, 2021 2:16 PM

To: Geary, Vanessa PREM:EX

Cc: Parkinson, Elizabeth PREM:EX
Subject: Re: Bob Dewar December 2020 invoice
looks good, thanks Vanessa

From: Geary, Vanessa PREM:EX

Sent: Wednesday, January 6, 2021 2:06:12 PM
To: Meggs, Geoff PREM:EX

Cc: Parkinson, Elizabeth PREM:EX

Subject: FW: Bob Dewar December 2020 invoice

Attached is Bob’s invoice and report for Dec. Please review and approve.

Note that to date, Bob has billed $104,267.50 (taking GST off) which means there is $15,732 Iefth
Travel expenses are only just over $5000 for the year with $30,000 budgeted, so there is room if fi
$120,000 which they may do by $5-10,000. We are tracking by month.

Thanks Vanessa

From: Parkinson, Elizabeth PREM:EX <Elizabeth.Parkinson@gov.bc.ca>
Sent: January 5, 2021 2:52 PM

To: Geary, Vanessa PREM:EX <Vanessa.Geary@gov.bc.ca>

Subject: Bob Dewar December 2020 invoice

Hi Vanessa,

Attached is Bob’s invoice, statement and my invoice Coding sheet for your approval.

Thanks,

Elizabeth Parkinson

Finance & Administration Officer
Office of the Premier | Government of British Columbia

501 Belleville St, Victoria, BC V8V 1X4 | 778-974-6082
E-mail: elizabeth.parkinson@gov.bc.ca

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: The above message contains confidential information intended for a specified individual and purpos . Th
s private and protected by law. Any copying or disclosure of this transmission by anyone other than the intended recipient is prohid
notify the sender immediately and delete this message and any attachments from your sys
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Bob Dewar CONSULTING

s.22

INVOICE

Vanessa Geary, Office of the Premier
Suite 740-999 Canada Place
Vancouver, B.C V6C 3E1

Date: 2021-01-05

Invoice NumberNR

November 30" to December 4™ 1 week
@54,250 per week

December 7" 3 hours at $150 per hour
December 8™ 1 hour at $150 per hour
December 9" 1 hour at $150 per hour
December 10™ 1 hour at $150 per hour
December 11" 1 hour at $150 per hour
December 14" 2 hours at $150 per hour
December 16" 1 hour at $150 per hour
December 17" 2 hours at $150 per hour
December 18" 2 hours at $150 per hour

Subtotal

GST

Total




Detailed work:

November 30" to December 4t - Worked in Victoria East Annex on various files cor
meetings with MLAs and Premier and political staff. 1 week.

December 7% — Zoom calls with staff and caucus 3.0 hours
December 8" — Audio calls with staff and caucus 1.0 hour
December 9t — Audio calls with staff and caucus 1.0 hour
December 10t — Audio calls with staff and caucus 1.0 hour
December 11" — Audio calls with staff and caucus 1.0 hours
December 14t — Zoom calls with staff and caucus 2.0 hours
December 16" — Audio calls with staff and caucus 1.0 hours
December 17" — Zoom calls with staff and caucus 2.0 hours
December 18" — Zoom calls with staff and caucus 2.0 hours




