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e Where ideas work
Travel Voucher (Restricted Use) °E13'34:'

Freedom of Information and Protection of Privacy: The personal information you are providing is collected for the purposes of travel
expense administration and under the authority of the Financial Administration Act. The collection, use and disclosure of personal
information is in accordance with the Freedom of Information and Protection of Privacy Act. If you have any questions regarding this
collection, please contact your Ministry's Director/Manager of Information and Privacy.

Name y Employee ID Phone Number
Sundhu, Ellora NR s.17
Client Organization Job Title Travel Group Code
Agriculture, Food and Fisheries Ministerial Advisor 3
5. Date Completed 6. Fiscal Year 7. Special Cheque Issue 8. Cheque Stub Information
2021/02/117 2021 EFT
Type of Travel 14, Reason for Travel Headquarters
In Province Relocation Victoria
12. Mailing Address for Cheque
5.22
16. 17. 18. 19. 20. & 21. 22, 20. & 21.
Travel Places Travelled Personal Other Meals Miscellaneous
Dates Vehicle Use | Transport Lodging
2021 Destination Start | End Km | Cost Costs | Claim |Cost Costs | Cost Describe
01/07 | Esso 7-11 gas 0921 1800 0.00 60.00 0.00
02/14 | Esso 7-11 gas 0942 | 1945 0.00 80.00 0.00
02/15 | Petro Canada gas 1452 1500 0.00 20.00 0.00
01/07 | BC Ferries 0951 1150 0.00 73.50 0.00
02/14 | BC Ferries 1609 | 1830 0.00 73.50 0.00
02/13 | UHAUL 1515 1650 0.00 0.00 715.54 | Moving Truck
01/02 | Esso 7-11 gas 0937 | 0940 0.00 80.00 0.00 800.00 | incidental movingy
expenses
36. 37. v 38. 39. 40.1515.54| Claim Total
TOTALS OF COLUMNS $0.00] $387.00 $0.00f $0.00| $s.22 $s.22 1902.54
Ms. 49, 50. 51. 52. 45.
Client Code Resp. Service Line STOB 6 Project Supplier Code Amount
130 29001 30000 5225 2900000 NR 1752.54% .22
130 29001 30000 5225 2900000 150.00
130
130
Less Travel Advance
130 | | |
54. 1902.54
AMOUNT DUE TO EMPLOYEE $s.22
45. Employee Signature (See Audit Trail) Print Name Date Signed
- Certified this travel expense claim is a true statement of
disbursements made and/or allowances to which | am entitled as
a result of travel on government business as detailed above and
for which | have not been and will not be reimbursed by any other
party.
56. Spending Authority Signature (See Audit Trail) Print Name Date Signed
- Certified correct pursuant to section 32 & 33 of the Financial
Administration Act and related policies.
57. Payment Authority Signature (See Audit Trail) Print Name Date Signed
- Requisition for payment pursuant to section 32 of the Financial
Administration Act.
I'==IN 10 (EFI-F0012 v2.6.1) Production *** Copyright © Government of British Columbia Ministry Spending Authority ARCS 1240-20

_ ) _ Ministry Payment Authority ARCS 1050-06
Feb. 19/21 email, attached: increase approval from Senior MA Sam Godfrey

gas: moving truck and X Ref E133415 for rental car

DJ Feb 19/21
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2 audit trail record(s) returned.

Page 2 of 3

Audit Trail for Travel Voucher (Restricted Use) E133461 for Sundhu, Ellora

Date/Time [ Who | On Behalf Of | Action | Next To Act
2021/02/17 12:46:16 Sundhu, Ellora Initiated Godfrey, Sam
(IDIRNR ) Sam.Godfrey@gov.bc.ca
Ellora.Sundhu@gov.bc.ca
2021/02/17 13:39:24 Godfrey, Sam v ApprovedFSA MIN OFF, FIN
(IDIRNR ) FINFSAMINOFF@gov.bc.cal
Sam.Godfrey@gov.bc.ca

Production *** Copyright © Government of British Columbia

http://eww.eforms.gov.bc.ca/Libraries/PrintFormsShell.htm
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Notes for Travel Voucher (Restricted Use) E133461 for Sundhu, Ellora
0 note(s) returned.
Created On |  Author | Note

Production *** Copyright © Government of British Columbia
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From: Janke, Debra FIN:EX

To: Wade, Debbie PREM:EX
Subject: RE: Relocation Expenses
Date: February 24, 2021 2:29:43 PM

Thanks, Debbie and | hope you have a splendid night.

Debra

From: Wade, Debbie PREM:EX <Debbie.Wade@gov.bc.ca>
Sent: February 24, 2021 2:26 PM

To: Janke, Debra FIN:EX <Debra.Janke@gov.bc.ca>

Cc: Hockin, Amber PREM:EX <Amber.Hockin@gov.bc.ca>
Subject: RE: Relocation Expenses

Hello Debra;
Nice to hear from you! We are doing great thanks, hope all is well with you and your family.

| can confirm that Ellora’s relocation amount approved by Amber Hockin, Deputy Chief of Staff is
$5000.

Please let me know if you have any other questions,
All the best,

Debbie Wade

Executive Coordinator and Human Resources Liaison
to Amber Hockin — Deputy Chief of Staff to the Premier
778-974-6075

From: Janke, Debra FIN:EX <Debra.Janke@gov.bc.ca>
Sent: February 24, 2021 2:21 PM

To: Wade, Debbie PREM:EX <Debbie.Wade@gov.bc.ca>
Subject: RE: Relocation Expenses

Hi Debbie,
| hope you and your family are well.

| have paid the attached Relocation Claims for Ellora Sundhu. | have indicated on the Relocation
Control Record that $5,000.00 is the total authorized Relocation amount. Please confirm.
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Thanks.

Debra

From: Wade, Debbie PREM:EX <Debbie.Wade@gov.bc.ca>
Sent: February 23, 2021 5:36 PM

To: Poldrugovac, Saija FIN:EX <Saija.Poldrugovac@gov.bc.ca>
Cc: Scriver, Stacy PSA:EX <Stacy.Scriver@gov.bc.ca>; Janke, Debra FIN:EX <Debra.lanke@gov.bc.ca>;

Laird, Patricia FIN:EX <Patricia.laird@gov.bc.ca>

Subject: Relocation Expenses

Hi Saija;

Further to our conversation last week regarding relocation expenses, we have confirmed that | will
be the contact. Stacy Scriver, Human Resources Advisor for the Executive Offices, suggested we
request a detailed explanation from employees when submitting their relocation expenses.

Going forward, and including any past submitted expenses, that are not straight forward and require
further explanation or approval, please forward to me. | will have Amber Hockin, Deputy Chief of
Staff review and advise if expenses are approved or not approved. | will then forward her response
to the appropriate Executive Financial Clerk.

Please advise if you have any questions or concerns.
Thanks!

Debbie Wade

Executive Coordinator and Human Resources Liaison

to Amber Hockin — Deputy Chief of Staff to the Premier
778-974-6075
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From: Godfrey, Sam AFF:EX ¥

To: Janke, Debra FIN:EX

Cc: Sundhu, Ellora AFF:EX

Subject: Fwd: Ellora Sundhu, Claim #E133461
Date: February 19, 2021 3:15:22 PM
Approved. «

Sent from my iPhone
Begin forwarded message:

From: "Sundhu, Ellora AFF:EX" <Ellora.Sundhu@gov.bc.ca>
Date: February 19, 2021 at 2:51:51 PM PST

To: "Godfrey, Sam AFF:EX" <Sam.Godfrey@gov.bc.ca>
Subject: FW: Ellora Sundhu, Claim #E133461

Hi Sam,
Could you please approve this email thread about my relocation expenses? ¥

Thank you!

From: Janke, Debra FIN:EX <Debra.Janke@gov.bc.ca>

Sent: Thursday, February 18, 2021 1:44 PM

To: Sundhu, Ellora AFF:EX <Ellora.Sundhu@gov.bc.ca>

Subject: RE: Ellora Sundhu, Claim #£133461

Hi Ellora,

You can just have Sam send a separate email approving the change or Sam can approve this email.

Thanks.

Debra

From: Sundhu, Ellora AFF:EX <Ellora.Sundhu@gov.bc.ca>
Sent: February 18, 2021 1:33 PM

To: Janke, Debra FIN:EX <Debra.Janke@gov.bc.ca>
Subject: RE: Ellora Sundhu, Claim #£133461

Okay, | will jest send you another assignment of wages form and send the eform off to Sam again.

Thanks
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From: Janke, Debra FIN:EX <Debra.Janke@gov.bc.ca>
Sent: Thursday, February 18, 2021 1:32 PM

To: Sundhu, Ellora AFF:EX <Ellora.Sundhu@gov.bc.ca>
Subject: RE: Ellora Sundhu, Claim #£133461

Hi Ellora,

| can add the $800.00 to E133461. By way of email, please have Sam approve as Expense Authority
the adjustment from $8-22 to $1,902.54. ¥

Thanks.

Debra

From: Sundhu, Ellora AFF:EX <Ellora.Sundhu@gov.bc.ca>
Sent: February 18, 2021 1:12 PM

To: Janke, Debra FIN:EX <Debra.Janke@gov.bc.ca>
Subject: RE: Ellora Sundhu, Claim #£133461

HI Debra,

| will send you another assignment of wages that covers the $3-22 . Do | need to add the $800
claim to the Eform?

The fuel was for the moving truck and returning the rental vehicle in January of 2021.
Thanks,

Ellora

From: Janke, Debra FIN:EX <Debra.Janke@gov.bc.ca>
Sent: Thursday, February 18, 2021 12:40 PM

To: Sundhu, Ellora AFF:EX <Ellora.Sundhu@gov.bc.ca>
Subject: RE: Ellora Sundhu, Claim #£133461

Hi Ellora,

You have attached the Assignment of Wages for the $800.00, but, it is not indicated or included in

the total reimbursement. Travel claim E133461 in the amount of $5-22 -requires an Assignment
of Wages. You can either complete another one for this amount or cross out the $800.00 and
include the $8.22 with your initials for the change.

Was the gas for the moving truck?
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Thanks.

Debra

From: Sundhu, Ellora AFF:EX <Ellora.Sundhu@gov.bc.ca>
Sent: February 17, 2021 12:52 PM

To: FIN FSA MIN OFF, FIN FSA MIN OFF FIN:EX <EINFSAMINOFF@gov.bc.ca>
Subject: Ellora Sundhu, Claim #£133461

Hi Debra,

| have initiated Sam Godfrey to approve my E-form. | am attaching the following receipt and
assignment of wages for the incidentals claim.

Thanks,

Ellora Sundhu

Ministerial Advisor to the Honourable Lana Popham
Ministry of Agriculture, Food and Fisheries

Mobile: 250-818-0235

Room 327, Parliament Buildings

501 Belleville St., Victoria, BC, VBW1X4
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From: Sundhu, Ellora AFF:EX

To: Janke, Debra FIN:EX

Subject: Claim #E133461

Date: February 19, 2021 12:25:45 PM
Attachments: Scan 20210218.pdf

Hi Debra,

| am attaching a new assignment of wages with the updated amount.

Thanks,
Ellora

From:\R <Ellora.Sundhu@gov.bc.ca>

Sent: Thursday, February 18, 2021 4:02 PM
To: Sundhu, Ellora AFF:EX <Ellora.Sundhu@gov.bc.ca>
Subject: Scan From <Device Name>
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Relocation Assistance and/or Househunting Expense Report
and Assignment of Wages Agreement

QO Employee Applicants: | acknowledge that | am moving and receiving relocation
expenses as a result of a staffing action. As such, | agree to the following conditions.

OR

Eﬁew Appointees: In consideration of the assistance / reimbursement of expenses of
$ /,903. 54 _asrequested here to assist in the payment of my relocation
and/or house hunting expenses in moving, | agree to the following conditions.

It is understood and agreed that should | resign from the service of the Government of
British Columbia prior to completing 24 months of service following relocation, the
amount of expenses / assistance granted to me will be repaid on the prorata basis of:

o One-twenty fourth of the total amount of relocation expenses / assistance and/or
house hunting expenses received for each full and partial month, if any, that my
employment falls short of 24 months full time (or equivalent service) following
relocation.

« Where the employee / appointee is at work beyond the 15" day of the final partial
month, that final partial month will be considered to be a completed month of
service for purposes of calculating the amount to be repaid.

For the purpose of repayment, the Minister of Finance is hereby authorized to recover
any outstanding portions of the relocation assistance through payroll deduction or other
remuneration deduction without further notice.

Nothing contained herein shall prejudice the right of the Ministry to recover any
outstanding advance or portion thereof after termination of employment.

I understand and agree to these terms and conditions.

Date: Emplayee’s ! New ointee’s Signature and Printed Name:
02/18/ R0 . Elora Stpcthis
Date: Witne,:is Signq_‘ture and Printed Name:

22322y JDy Y| Yode Lo

Complete and sign in duplicate lé}n’l'return two copies to the issuing office. Retain
a copy for your personal records.

Note: Canada Customs and Revenue Agency may deem this to be taxable allowance and
should be contacted directly for further information.
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TNy TION HECORD

ESSO 7-ELEUEN 179y

li!*“li‘.ltl.‘ll!

5201 DOUGLAS ST
VICTORIR 80 U8Z 415

~821-91-97 89:21:93

TRANS - 303578
STATIONH : 80302481
G3T #: R119335454
GSTU #: #11933545 3

** FINAL RECEIPT »~

PUNP 2

EREG $ 60.08
46.9121. AT $1.279/L

GST INCLUDED § 2 _g¢
TOTAL : CADS 60.08

MASTERCARD ¢ 46 o83

TYPE: PURCHASE
MASTERCARD -
a3 e 36903 e 3 N R
REFERENCE #:
66434088 6010014308H
INVDICE NO: NR
AUTH: B1987E

CAPITAL ONE
ABGAREABBN1610
gseenuBagy

FF 7/ DT '®8

81/0827 APPROVED
THHHK YOU

LOYALTY : NO

GET OM THE ROAD TO
{HORT REWARDS BY
EARNING ESSO EXTRA
OR PC OPTIMUi PODIdIT
ON GAS, CAR UASHE"
AND ELIGIBLE
CONVENIENCE
PURCHRSES?
QUESTIONS?
1-800-567- 3776

RECONSILIATION tu:
NR

<
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TRANSACTION RECORD

ESS0 7-ELEVEN 37774

FEFREREAE R R

s.22

ESS0 EXPRESS PAY

2021-82-14 089:42:21

TERM ID: 36684018
TRANS #: 348653
STATION#: 00302702
GST #: R119335453
GSTU #: R119335453
PUMP 5

EREG $ 80.006

64.6851L AT $1.249/L

GST INCLUDED § 3.81
TOTAL : CADS 80.00
DEBIT $ 86.00

4

TYPE: PURCHASE
INTERAC

3 363636 3 96 26 26 30 26 N R
ACCOUNT TYPE:
CHEQUING

REFERENCE #:
36684018 B0161500706C
INUOICE ND: NR

AUTH: 134431

INTERAC
ADDBOBB27716810
0080608000
E800

UERIFIED BY PIN

00/601 APPROVED
THANK YOUu

LOYALTY: HNO

GET ON THE ROAD TO
MORE REWARDS BY
EARNING ESSO EXTRA
OR PC OPTIMUM POINTS
ON GAS, CAR WASHES,
AND ELIGIBLE
CONVENIENCE
PURCHASES?
QUESTIONS?
1-800-567-3776

RECONCILIATION ID:
NR
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PETRNO-CANADN
2670 DODUGLAS &T.
UILTORIA
BRITISH COLUMI:IA
UBT4Me
(2508)--386-23 2

GST #: 8647'844Y
PST #: 168:!12185
PCO69759: 8191211001
PAYPOINT : 8191211601
TERMINAL : 819121053
INUOICE HO: NR

«

2021-02-15 14 52

PUMP 3
REGULAR
18.717L AT $1.959/L

FUEL SALES § 20.00
6ST INCLUDED  $6.95

TOTAL $20.00
DEBIT $70.08 v

TYPE: PURCHASE

INTERAC

63633696 36 36 3¢ i 2 N R (
" ACCOUNT TYPE:

CHEQUING

AUTH #: 198.'87

SYSTRACE : 161483

INTERAC

AOOBBO027 71014
06800086130
E8B0

UERIFIED BY PIN

080/008 APPROVED
THANK YOl

-~ IMPORTANT --
RETAIN THIS COP"
FOR YOUR RECORD:
- CUSTOMER'S cOI'Y -

GIVE US Youn
FEEDBRCK.
CHANCEE TO WIN
FREE GAS FOR A “EAR?
PETRO-CAHADA.CA, HERD

-2021-
YOU COULD HAUE Page 13 of 18 FIN-2021-11837
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Swartz Bay
To
Tsawwassen

~RCFerries

Victoria BC Canada VBW BB7

RECEIPT - PLEASE RETAIN
PURCHASE 2021/04407 ~

20’ Undersize Vehi 57.50

1 Adult . 17.20
Fuel Rebate 1.20-

. Total 78.50

“Interac FLASH DEFAUL"

VW W W W W W W o
AUTH 462927 66307789 BBLORL7628 H
Intrras -
'ABBERBER77101801UB0GEES £ 209g290PspaRe
ND SIGNATURE TRANSACTION
82 APPROVED - THANK YOU @el

"CHANGE DUE 0.00

«

***CARDHOLDER COPY™*x*
SWB 07 Jan 2021 09:51:32

NR
SE ET
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Tsawwassen

To
Swartz Bay

ABCFerries

Suite 508 - 1321 Blanshard Street
WﬂwuBChthWEW

-
-

RECEIPT - PLERSE RETAIN

PURCHASE 2021/02/14 ~

20" Oversize Vehic 57.50

1 Adult 17.20

Fuel Rebate 1.20-

Total 73.50
Interac FLASH DEFAULT

***l‘*t"*t'{i* ?3‘
AUTH 192897 66387717 BO10E1611E H
Interac
ROBBEBBE2771810 / eessoeeenn 7
NO SIGNATURE TRANSACTION
B8 APPROVED - THRANK YOU @ol

«

CHANGE DUE ©.00
***CARDHOLDER COPY»***
TSA 14 Feb 2021 16:09:48
NR
SE T
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NR
»Rriginmaer T S
U-HAUL Equipment Contra One-Way Rental
Contract No: 87829625 ﬁuigmnt: Roadside Assistance: Dispatched From: s 29
Saturday. Fabriary 13 2021 315 PM uhaut comheln Safe-Protection: (YES)
Customer Name: $.22 Renting Location:
s.22 U-HAUL MOVING & STORAGF 0FS.22
s.22
Dro OﬂE:uigment At: Address «Due Date/Time: 2152021 200 o4
m’l ! " e Days Allowed: 2
; PRSI Nen you artive in VICTORIA, MCTORIA, BC VBRLCS Mﬁﬂm 120
BC (778) 746757 2 Ifyou return after store hours please verisy your equipment
return on your mobile device by going to uhaulcomd=hare, Or
Destination: yau can choose to have a U-Hau Represontatve ver .
VICTORIA, BC the next businessday There is 3 $20.00 convenience [ae
option.
Extra day rate for the T $40.00 per day. $0.40 Per Mi Exiraday rate for the CDW $15.00 per day
Equipment Mi Out Coverage Rental Charge Total Charges: l
TM - 10" Moving Van 291230 CDW: $50.00 $587 00 $637.00
TME0251
AHTE037-AZ e .. - e D
Fuel Tank Capacity:124 Liters
[E Y Y % % % u ¥ F ]
mlé!!|f!.‘l|lillllll
6 360 103 767 151 i
; Li ispate Environmental Fee: $5.00
Estimated Liters needed to return to dispatched level of 3/8 Subtotal: Sf:42 00
Card Type: Account: Type: Ref No.: Approved: GST/ ;‘g 'Tr"“f ;iﬂg
CREDIT_CARD D000 000G00-NR PAYMENT 000042724785 425678 Total Rental Ch arg:: 171584
Entry Method: CHIP  Application Label: Merchant i1D: Term ID: 001 y i
CREDIT_CARL 6061650 Credit Card Payment: 571554
AID: ADOCOOTC031010 TYR: 0000003000 TSI: EBOD Verifed By PIN Net Paid Today: 571554 ¥

o |agreetoverify my truck's fuel level is 3/8" betore leaving the premises. | wif return the vehicle with the same amount of fuel as waen disparched andror
agreefopay a 3159 per iter convenience fee for the estimated fuel | donat repiace If returned with less than 14 1anx, | agrea to.ai0 pay a $30.00 service
fee. U Hauldoes notreimburse if this truck is returned with more fuelthan what is printed on the rece pt gai ige. U-Haut pays for o jsave ~oceipts),

® Anautomobile labiiity nsurance palicy or a qualified self-insurancs arrangement provides the authorized criver weth 1he mn imwrirmits ceqeired by the
automobile financial responsibility or compulsary insurance law of the jurisdiction in which the actident oeurs,

| understanc thar this equipment must ba returned ta one of the U-Haul drop-off lacations listed on this contract or | must call the rivop off pumbar

= |understand that ile enuipment rented is water resistant and nat water proof,

* |acknowledge that ! have received the a poropriate User Instructions and acknowledge my responsibility to 1ully read anc understand it cse L ser
Instructions before aperatng the equipment,

s lunderstang that | will recsive an ermai link to review the rental process and the U-Haul Store employeestofeedback 1 U-Hai' any compiaints, concerrs,
or requests that | nave about my rantal.

& lunderstand that| ran also contact U-Haul Customer Service at il 1wt conveonitact/email aspx

& Watch for overhead objects and lock-up the cargobox. | understand that & collv, or Wll’il an averhead object and theft of ry cargo e e Just twio soecific
exclusions ner covered by Collision Damage Wanver (COW), Safemave, or Safetow protection,

® | agreethat distracted! drving 5 dangerows and that driving while distractad is ikely tolead to an accident/crash caue B sericusirury o deah. | agree
nottouse & hand held mobiie phane (other than for an emerr:s:nw cail) and not totext whie driving any U-Haui truck or owing ary U-Haal Trailer, Tow
Dally or Auto Transport My agreement not to do sois material to U Haul's decison to enter inta this Agr éament. My faili:re to comnply is material breach of
this Agresment,

° TheAfé:owmg shal be admssibie at ev-dence of negligence and breach of contrac in any lawsuit or arbitraton: 1) that *he driver of the U-Raui i uck, of
vehide towing any U-Haul Trailer, Tow Dolly or Auto ransport was texting while driving; 2) thatthe driver of tive U Haul truck. or velids to fig any L.
Haul Traifer, Tew Dally or Auto Tras =port, was using any mabile phone (other than hands free ar for an emergency call whie driving

. | aﬁree tasuomit all ‘egal ciaims in accordarn ce with the U Haul Arbitranon Agreement incorporated by reference, and availab ¢ at Lhauleoryarbitration
oriromrmy Iocal U-Haul representative.

o larknosedge that ! have received and agree o the terms and conditons of this Reatal Contract and the Rertal Contract Adeen:, n,

o | acknowiedge that | was sent a text/email to the phone number of arrai’ address provided at the time of the rentar, which provides e the COPUTINITY TO
acknowledge equ-nmens condition, tleaniiness, mileage and et ai the time F e rentzl | unde stane thatit ! nonat nrpeede at Tl Lo, ating
e corhbion o e eer v e et omar | rrther ackit s BORE a1 2y 12 TRSpOns Lie 1o any and st Sanage Leaning, HeLpT il @ argos
asdetermingd by  baviupon retern of the equipment,

PAULA ANDERSON

s.22 U-Haul Signature - (PAULA ANDERS N}
For hotel discounts, please visit www.uh aul corvdiscounts

Questions or need help? Call me, s.22

69461162(H) 03/17
PointOfSale
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TRANSACTION RECORD

ESSD 7 ELEUEH 37898

FAlAFxRad b s n iy
201 DOUGLAS 5T
VICTORIR  BC UBZ 3K8

ESSO EXPRESS PAY

+

2821 -01-02 09:37:49

TRANS f#: 441286
STATIONH: aH3 82481
GST H: R119235%453

GSTU #: R119335453

PUMP 8
EREG $ 80.00
61.586L AT $1.299/L

6ST INCLUDED § 4.B1
TOTAL : CADY 80.08
MASTERCARD ¢ 80.088 ~

TYPE: PURCHRSE
MASTERCARD

RN ﬁ***l**l*-NR
REFERENCE #:
66458176 VO100156000
INUDICE HO: NR
AUTH: B24%95E

CAPITAL OHNE
ABO00BBGHELT1610
0000008000
ESap

UERIFIED BY PIN

01/827 APPROVED
THANK You

LOYALTY: NO

GET ON THE ROAD TO
MORE REWARDS BY
EARMING t.50 EXTRA
OR PC OPY!iiuiM POINTS
ON GRS, CAR “ASHES,
AND ELIGIEBLE
CONVENIENCE
PURCHASES?
QUESTIONS?
1-880-567-3776

RECONCILYATION 1D:
NR
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Relocation Assistance and/or Househunting Expense Report
and Assignment of Wages Agreement

O Employee Applicants: | acknowledge that | am moving and receiving relocation
expenses as a result of a staffing action. As such, | agree to the following conditions.

OR

New Appointees: In consideration of the assistance / reimbursement of expenses of
$ £00.00 as requested here to assist in the payment of my relocation
and/or house hunting expenses in moving, | agree to the following conditions.

It is understood and agreed that should | resign from the service of the Government of
British Columbia prior to completing 24 months of service following relocation, the
amount of expenses / assistance granted to me will be repaid on the prorata basis of:

» One-twenty fourth of the total amount of relocation expenses / assistance and/or
house hunting expenses received for each full and partial month, if any, that my
employment falls short of 24 months full time (or equivalent service) following
relocation.

o Where the employee / appointee is at work beyond the 15" day of the final partial
month, that final partial month will be considered to be a completed month of
service for purposes of calculating the amount to be repaid.

For the purpose of repayment, the Minister of Finance is hereby authorized to recover
any outstanding portions of the relocation assistance through payroll deduction or other
remuneration deduction without further notice.

Nothing contained herein shall prejudice the right of the Ministry to recover any
outstanding advance or portion thereof after termination of employment.

| understand and agree to these terms and conditions.

Date: Employee’s / pointee’s Signature and Printed Name:
0&// ?A?O Xl W . E/lora Sundahu

Date: ‘Witness Signature and Printed Name:

O N[0\ FO\%e,LwDQ

Complete and sign in duplicate and return two copies to the issuing office. Retain
a copy for your personal records.

Note: Canada Customs and Revenue Agency may deem this to be taxable allowance and
should be contacted directly for further information.
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