From: Perrin, Kathy L HLTH:EX

To: Hith Accounts Payable HLTH:EX
Cc: Gross, Steve HLTH:EX
Subject: NLK Strategies Inc. - 200210
Date: May 29, 2020 12:14:05 PM
Attachments: Inv# 200210.pdf
Importance: High

PO# 2020-109
Receipt# 63523

From: Gross, Steve HLTH:EX

Sent: May 7, 2020 9:35 AM

To: Perrin, Kathy L HLTH:EX

Subject: FW: NLK Strategies Invoices Feb/March/April 2020 (Invoice #200408 and 200210)

Importance: High

Hi

For processing . Thanks

From: Murray, Heather HLTH:EX <Heather.Murray@gov.bc.ca>

Sent: May 7, 2020 9:13 AM

To: Gross, Steve HLTH:EX <Steve.Gross@gov.bc.ca>

Cc: Moulton, Holly HLTH:EX <Holly.Moulton@gov.bc.ca>

Subject: NLK Strategies Invoices Feb/March/April 2020 (Invoice #200408 and 200210)

Importance: High

Good Morning Steve,

Please find attached two invoices for NLK Strategies to be processed. Holly Moulton has signed for

good/services received and Peter Pokorny has signed as EA.
e Invoice 200210 — February 2020 (you had confirmed this has not yet been processed)
¢ Invoice 200408 — March 27 to 31 and April 2020

Please have the project code identified under Covid-19.

Thank you for your help! Heather.

Sincerely,

Heather Murray | A/Senior Manager

Office of the Associate Deputy Minister's

Ministry of Health

Phone: 250.952.2879 | Cell: 250.415.5856

Warning: This email is intended only for the use of the individual or organization to whom it is addressed. It may
contain information that is privileged or confidential. Any distribution, disclosure, copying, or other use by anyone
else is strictly prohibited. If you have received this in error, please telephone or e-mail the sender immediately and
delete the message.
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INVOICE # Contract# DATE

200210 2020-109 2020-03-02

Attention: Holly Moulton

Ministry of Health

Office of the Deputy Minister

PO Box 9639, Stn Prov Govt

5th Floor - 1515 Blanchard Street
Victoria, BC V8W 9P1

Services
Strategic counsel provided from February 4 to 29, 2020, including:
Strategic communications counsel and media relations support to
BC's Provincial Health Officer for communications and response
related to the COVID-19 outbreak

February -4, 5, 6, 7, 8, 10, 11, 12, 13, 14, 18, 19, 20, 21, 23, 24, 25, 26, 27, 28, 29

40 hours @ $ 200.00 $ 8,000.00
$ 8,000.00
Disbursements / Other Charges
$ s
Fees & Disbursements $ 8,000.00
GST (5% on fees & disbursements) $ 400.00
MINISTRY OF HEALTH
SUPPLIER # ¥ SITE
1_ I Balance Due 8,400.00
CAS COMMITMENT # LINE #

blebio | 44855 (aO
PRO.IECT,'.———__ ngm w

70 # {CONTRACT &) GFA® YOI
SD30-107 026
GOODS / SERVEES RECEIVED BY
L /\\ D.\TE% 4 é,? u?n

CERTIFIED. CORRECT PURSUANT TO SECTIOI
ATION ACT & RELA POLI-CIES

(%% ws/"é)’ /Z”

Mibe, B / TINS AUTHORITY SIGNATURE

GST # 767034713 RT0001
Payable due in 30 days. Please make cheques payable to NLK Strategies Inc.
238 West 17 Street, North Vancouver, BC V7IM1V6
604.970.9113 / info@nlkstrategies.ca
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OLD YEAR = JV aute-reverse accrual¥ HE20JVSGDDT

This corfract was nat sel up with expenses, receiving all on lees line as per Steve.
EXPENSE AUTHORITY EMAIL APPROVAL IS NOT REQUIRED; appraval will be requestad in Oracla,
QUALIFIED RECEIVER MUST ENTER NAME IN THE FOLLOWING QR BLOCK:

| certify that the work has been performed, goods

Hally Maulton

received or conditions met.

INSTRUCTIONS:

1. Comglete the sectians of the Cading Bleck belaw. Any of the olher secfians yau are unsure abau, kave blank, or sk Steve ! Kathy,
Ensure the subject line of the email has the supplier's name and invaice number. eg, E-lmvoice BOE'S PLUMBING - 1234

W oR o e

Forward email {and cc the EA)

TRANSACTION INFORMATI

to

Forward the email. with the invaice atached (ensuring the scan is legible). 1o the Qualified Receiver.
Once OR approval is ablained, they will larward the email back ta you {Admin stalf)

Supplier Name MLE Strategies Inc. Supplier Nurnber| Sita # 2871189 | 001
Invoice Date Mar 30, 2020 Irvoice 4 200308
Invoice Rec'd Date Apr 1, 2020
CQualified Receivar Holly Moulton Expense Authority Pater Pokorny
| iPro Receipt # | 63196 & 63241 | ros | 2020-109

PRI

1 026 66010 44225 6001 6600000 26,423 62 1,321.18 27,744.80
Pre-Tax Amaunt 2642362
ST
GST 132118
| Payment Amount [27.744.80 ]
DESCRIPTION

From: HLTH Exe:
Sent: April 2, 2020 11:25 AM
To: Perrin, Kathy L HLTH:EX

Subjeet: F.
Far processing

From: Murray, Heather HLTH:EX <};
Sent: April 1, 2020 1:34 PM

To: HLTH Executive Operations HLTH

Subject: FW:
Flease find below and attached an i
Let e know if you need any additi

Thanks, Heather

Heather Murray |

Warning. 5 intended aniy for
efar, pigase lelephong or 8-ms

EXPENSE AUTHORITY EMAIL APPROVAL IS NOT REH
QUALIFIED RECEIVER MUST ENTER NAME IN THE FOLLOWING QR BLOCK:

I certify that the work has been performed, goods | Holly Moulton
received or conditions met.

ve Operations HLTH

fhe sendsr im

nwoice - NLK Strategies Inc. - Invit 200308

gather Murrs

X <HLTH.EQFinar
Ine. - Irnu# 200308
meoice for processing
snal information or background

IRED; appraval will be requested in Oracle,

INSTRUCTIONS:

Lol ol ol

Complete the sections of the Coging Block belaw. Any of the other sections you are unsure about, leave blank, of ask Steve | Kathy.
Ensure the subject line af the email has the supplier's name and invaice number. g, E-Invoice BOB'S PLUMBING - 1234
Forward the email, wilh the invaice attached (ensuring the scan is legible). 1o the Qualified Receiver.

Once OR approval is ablained, they will lorward the email back to you [Admin stalf).
Forward email {and cc the EA) to

TRANSACTION INFORMATI

formation that i priviaged or confider

ial. Any distribetion, dissiosure, copying, or other uss by anyone el

i prahibited. i

Supplier Name

NLE Strategies Inc

Supplier Number| Sita #

MO0

| o

Invoice Date

Mar 2, 2020

Invaice i

200308

Invoice Rec'd Date

Mar 27, 2020

CQualified Receivar

olly Maulton

Expense Authority

Peter Pokorny

| iPro Receipt #

| ooix

| Po#

| 2020109

1 026 BG010 &0 600000 26,200.00 132118 27.744.80
2 026 66010 XK E600000 22362 21362

ave received this
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Pre-Tax Amount 26,200.00

PST
GST 132118
| Payment Amount [27.744.80 |

DESCRIPTION
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INVOICE# Contract# DATE
200308 2020-109 2020-03-02

Attention: Holly Moulton

Ministry of Health

Office of the Deputy Minister

PO Box 9639, Stn Prov Govt

5th Floor - 1515 Blanchard Street
Victoria, BC V8W 9P1

Services
Strategic counsel provided from March 2 to 26, 2020, including:
Strategic communications counsel and media relations support to
BC's Provincial Health Officer for communications and response
related to the COVID-19 outbreak

March 2, 3,4,5,6,7,8,9,10, 11,12, 13, 14, 16, 17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 23, 24, 25, 26

131 hours @ $ 200.00 $26,200.00
$ 26,200.00
Disbursements / Other Charges
Parking $ 223.62
(see attached receipts)
$ 223.62
Fees & Disbursements $ 26,423.62
GST (5% on fees & disbursements) $ 1,321.18
Balance Due 27,744.80

GST # 767034713 RT0001
Payable due in 30 days. Please make cheques payable to NLK Strategies Inc.
238 West 17 Street, North Vancouver, BC V7IM1V6

604.970.9113 / info@nlkstrategies.ca
HTH-2020-04186 5 of 13 Page



Canada Place Parkade

820 Canada Place
Vancouver BC, VBC 3C1

Pay Station Number: 1

Entered: 03/07/2020
08:48

Exited: 03/07/2020
11:02

Ticket Number: 122

Transaction Nurber: 8125

Rate: A

Parking Fee: $20.00

Total Fee: $20.00

Fee Paid: $20.00

Visa

XO000000000NEEa2

Approval Nurber: 081751

Thark you far visting
Canada Place
Aoove anount. includes 5% GST
GSTH# 120886085RT006

Canada Place Parkade

898 Canada Place
Vancouver BC, VBC 3C1

Pay Station Number: 1

Entered: 03/06/2020
07:52

Exited: 08/06/2020
16:12

Ticket Numoer: 45128

Transaction Number: 81128

Rate: A

Parking Fee: $19.00

Total Fee: $18.00

Fee Paid: $18.00

Visa

2000000000NEEE2

Approval Number: 087231

Thark you for visting
Canada Place
Above amount Includes 5% GST
GSTH# 120896056R 10006

Canada Place Parkade

889 Canada Place
Varcouver BC, VBC 3C1

Pay Station Number: 1
Entered: 03/13/2020
13:28
Exitad: ' (8/13/2020
17:13
Ticket Nunber: 11788
Trarsaction Nuber: 81458
Rate: A
Parking Fee: $23.00
Total Fee: $23.00
Fee Paid: $23.00
Visa
XOOCO000000EBE32
Approval Nunber: 45351

Therk you for visting
Canada Place
Avove amount includes 5% GST
GST# 120886006R 10006
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-
'

§VERIFIED BY PIN

§01 APPROVED-THANK YoU 027
i -
Net total $12.00
TLT  24% $2.88
GST 5% $0.74

N

777 HORNBY ST VANCOUVER

—_—

GST#814409538RT0001
Incl. Translink Tax/G.S.T

EXIT 1A
Receipt 040381

Short-term parking tkt
UPLVL . 00023
05/02/20 07:29
05/02/20 10:11

Period 0d2h43"

(TLTGST) $12
Net total $12.
V.A.T. $3.
Gross total $15.
Payment

nge: PURCHASE $315
VISA CREDIT

RDO 'ttliltti*ﬂisgas

05/02/20 10:

- L |

.62

REF: 664611220014550050C

AUTH #: 044281
A0000000031010
0080008000 F800

INSE
THIS END UP

TERMINAL CITY CLUB
RECEIPT A2

IN: ©04,82,20 11:85
0UT: 24,02.28 17:11
GST No, 119328513
RRENANNNNIRGG)
VISA: $25.00
AuBddg71-002000a11
APPROVED

tRetain this copv?

Canada Place Parkade

899 Carada Place
Vancouver BC, VBC 3C1

Pay Station Numoer: 5
Entered: 02/14/2020
11:32
Exited: 02/14/2020
13:44
Ticket Nurber: 2253
Transaction Nutber: a1z7
Rate: A
Parkirg Fee: $20.00
Total Fee: $20.00
Fea Paid: $20.00
Visa
KOO000000KXBE2
Acproval Nurber: 080451

Thark you for visting
Canada Place
Above amount includes 5% GST
GST# 1208660910006
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Caraca Place Parkage | CABfice,Farkace

889 Canada Place Vancouver BC, VBC C1
Vancowver BC, VBC 301 |

Canada Place Parkade

820 Canada Place
Vancouver BC, VBC 3C1

1

Nurber: .
Entared: (3/21/2020 12:28 Entared: %
’ 10:01 Exited: 03/19/2020 _ ’
Exiteq: 03/21/2020 19:49 Exited: 03/20/2020
13:49 icket Nuoer: 12442 e
Ticket Number: 125;57 D, i N.am“ 81555 Ticket Nurber: 12512
Transaction Number: 81573 ];;:aact ch ’ A Transaction Nurber: 81566
o A Parking Fee: $32.00 - ) 8
Parking Fee: $23.00 Parking Fee: $23.00
. Total Fee: $32.00 _
Total Fee: $23. 0 Fen. Paid: $40.00 Total Fee $23.00
Fee Paid: m o 2 mm Fee Paid: 323.(13
Visa i Creres: Visa
200000000000BEI2 K000000000XBEa2
Aroval Nt Thark you far visting ; ; 1
' ; Q07001 Canacha Place Acproval Nuber: 06283
Above amount includes 5% GST o
Therk you for visting GST# 1200G600ERTOC6 Thark you for visting
Canada Place Canada Place
Acove amount. incliviee 5% foT Above amount includes 6% GST
GST# 1 ~OTH 120806096RT006
.8 e = — = o A
ég@%i& 8, 88 :
x
TR "
— -3
a B
855 -g 3 |
adt 3 es s
gf 2 ~ . : 3§58 |
5 85 3| 3. §0F-
gg § g » | E% &5 55
o oS - &
5 a8 3 § £ ﬂ § :3 L@ g E HTH-2020-04186 8 of 13 Page




INVOICE# Contract# DATE
200308 2020-109 2020-03-02

Attention: Holly Moulton

Ministry of Health

Office of the Deputy Minister

PO Box 9639, Stn Prov Govt

5th Floor - 1515 Blanchard Street
Victoria, BC V8W 9P1

Strategic counsel provided from March 2 to 26, 2020, including:
Strategic communications counsel and media relations support to
BC's Provincial Health Officer for communications and response
related to the COVID-19 outbreak
March 2, 3, 4, 5, 6, 7, 8,9, 10, 11, 12, 13, 14, 16, 17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 23, 24, 25, 26

131 hours @ $ 200.00 $26,200.00
$ 26,200.00
Disbursements / Other Charges
Parking $ 223.62
(see attached receipts)
$ 223.62
Fees & Disbursements $ 26,423.62
GST (5% on fees & disbursements) $ 1,321.18
Balance Due 27,744.80
/% LA 0 Zon

4.4/- !/ / &ezo

GST # 767034713 RT0O001
Payable due in 30 days. Please make cheques payable to NLK Strategies Inc.
238 West 17 Street, North Vancouver, BC V7IM1V6
604.970.9113 / info@nlkstrategies.ca
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From: Perrin, Kathy L HLTH:EX

To: Hith Accounts Payable HLTH:EX
Cc: Gross, Steve HLTH:EX
Subject: NLK Strategies Inc. - 200408
Date: May 29, 2020 12:14:59 PM
Attachments: Inv# 200408.pdf
Importance: High

PO# 2020-109
Receipt# 63524

From: Gross, Steve HLTH:EX

Sent: May 7, 2020 9:35 AM

To: Perrin, Kathy L HLTH:EX

Subject: FW: NLK Strategies Invoices Feb/March/April 2020 (Invoice #200408 and 200210)

Importance: High

Hi

For processing . Thanks

From: Murray, Heather HLTH:EX <Heather.Murray@gov.bc.ca>

Sent: May 7, 2020 9:13 AM

To: Gross, Steve HLTH:EX <Steve.Gross@gov.bc.ca>

Cc: Moulton, Holly HLTH:EX <Holly.Moulton@gov.bc.ca>

Subject: NLK Strategies Invoices Feb/March/April 2020 (Invoice #200408 and 200210)

Importance: High

Good Morning Steve,

Please find attached two invoices for NLK Strategies to be processed. Holly Moulton has signed for

good/services received and Peter Pokorny has signed as EA.
e Invoice 200210 — February 2020 (you had confirmed this has not yet been processed)
¢ Invoice 200408 — March 27 to 31 and April 2020

Please have the project code identified under Covid-19.

Thank you for your help! Heather.

Sincerely,

Heather Murray | A/Senior Manager

Office of the Associate Deputy Minister's

Ministry of Health

Phone: 250.952.2879 | Cell: 250.415.5856

Warning: This email is intended only for the use of the individual or organization to whom it is addressed. It may
contain information that is privileged or confidential. Any distribution, disclosure, copying, or other use by anyone
else is strictly prohibited. If you have received this in error, please telephone or e-mail the sender immediately and
delete the message.

HTH-2020-04186 10 of 13 Page



INVOICE # Contract# DATE

200408 2020-109 2020-05-02

Attention: Holly Moulton

Ministry of Health

Office of the Deputy Minister

PO Box 9639, Stn Prov Govt

5th Floor - 1515 Blanchard Street
Victoria, BC V8W 9P1

Strategic counsel provided from March 27 to April 30, 2020, including:

Strategic communications counsel and media relations support to
BC's Provincial Health Officer for communications and response
related to the COVID-19 outbreak

March 27, 28, 30, 31
April 14, 6-11, 13-18, 20-25, 27-30

112 hours @ $ 200.00 $22,400.00
$ 22,400.00

Disbursements / Other Charges

$ "
i MINISTRY OF HEALTH ' Fees & Disbursements $ 22,400.00
SUPPLIER # SITE GST (5% on fees & disbursements) $ 1,120.00
CAS CD'\lWINENT 1] Igl; |
RESP SERVICE NE 90. Balance Due 23,520.00
010 | HUFAT | (0
TROJECT! AMOL " -
23, 530.00
PO # L CONTRACHS ' GFa® CUEN
D- /09 026
''\CES RECEIVED BY
& T——
onte/ Lrg { N

" *'7'"D CORRECT PURSUANT TO SECTIONS 32 & 33 OF
. TRATION ACT & RELATED POLICIES

GST # 767034713 RT0001
Payable due in 30 days. Please make cheques payable to NLK Strategies Inc.
238 West 17 Street, North Vancouver, BC VIM1V6
604.970.9113 / info@nlkstrategies.ca
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From: Perrin, Kathy L HLTH:EX

To: Hith Accounts Payable HLTH:EX
Cc: Gross, Steve HLTH:EX
Subject: NLK Strategies Inc. - 200508
Date: June 3, 2020 11:09:11 AM
Attachments: Inv#t 2 .pdf

PO# 2020-109
Receipt# 63549

From: Gross, Steve HLTH:EX

Sent: June 3, 2020 8:56 AM

To: Perrin, Kathy L HLTH:EX

Subject: FW: Invoice #200508 - NLK Strategies Inc. (May 2020)
Hi

Can you please see the status of this payment?

Thanks

From: Murray, Heather HLTH:EX <Heather.Murray@gov.bc.ca>

Sent: June 3, 2020 8:53 AM

To: Gross, Steve HLTH:EX <Steve.Gross@gov.bc.ca>

Subject: Invoice #200508 - NLK Strategies Inc. (May 2020)

Good Morning Steve,

Are you able to process the attached NLK Strategies invoice for May?

Holly Moulton signed for Goods/Services received and Peter Pokorny is the Expense Authority.
Following this payment, are you able to provide me with a status update as to funds remaining in her
current contract?

Thank you, Heather.

Sincerely,
Heather Murray | A/Senior Manager
Office of the Associate Deputy Minister's

Ministry of Health

Phone: 250.952.2879 | Cell: 250.415.5856

Warning: This email is intended only for the use of the individual or organization to whom it is addressed. It may
contain information that is privileged or confidential. Any distribution, disclosure, copying, or other use by anyone
else is strictly prohibited. If you have received this in error, please telephone or e-mail the sender immediately and
delete the message.
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INVOICE # Contract# DATE

200508 2020-109 2020-06-01

Attention: Holly Moulton

Ministry of Health

Office of the Deputy Minister

PO Box 9639, Stn Prov Govt

5th Floor - 1515 Blanchard Street
Victoria, BC V8W 9P1

Strategic counsel provided from May 1 to May 30, 2020, including:

Strategic communications counsel and media relations support to
BC's Provincial Health Officer for communications and response
related to the COVID-19 outbreak

May 1-2, 4-9, 11-16, 18-23, 25-30

116 hours @ $ 200.00 $23,200.00
' $ 23,200.00

Disbursements / Other Charges

$ 5
MINISTRY OF HEALTH Fees & Disbursements §$ 23,200.00
s Ll e GST (5% on fees & disbursements) $ 1,160.00
AR IDUMCTVENT ¥ LINE #
ORb
RESP SERV' E LINE ST08B Balance Due 24,360.00
2016 | 44935 | o
PROJECT & U i

B = (CONTRACT &) GFAR

nmfznc_ C Zo20)

CERTIFIED CORRECT PURSUANT O SECTIONS 32 & 33 OF

T‘%TRHION ACT & RELATED POLICIES
; oaTe /-ve Z,é e¢d
ITY TURE

MINISTRY SPENDING / DERTIFICATIONS AUTHOR

GST # 767034713 RT0001
Payable due in 30 days. Please make cheques payable to NLK Strategies Inc.
238 West 17 Street, North Vancouver, BC VZM1V6
604.970.9113 / info@nlkstrategies.ca
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