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Notes for Travel Voucher (Restricted Use) E131438 for Eby, David
1 note(s) returned.

Created On | Author | Note
2019/06/22 18:31:22 Normand, Nicole May 30, taxi fm Van Helijet 27.65 x ref tv
(IDIRINNORMAND) 131348
Nicole.Normand@gov.bc.ca June 1, AG Ministry mtgs, parking 7.62

June 3, AG Ministry mtgs, parking 25.00
June 4, AG Ministry mtgs, parking 19.00
June 10, AG Ministry mtgs, taxi 30.00
June 11, AG Ministry mtgs, parking 19.00
June 12, AG Ministry mtgs, parking 19.00
June 13, AG Ministry mtgs, parking 14.50
June 14, AG Ministry mtgs, parking 26.00
June 15, AG Ministry mtgs, parking 3.00
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Notes for Travel Voucher (Restricted Use) E131527 for Eby, David
1 note(s) returned.

Created On | Author | Note
2019/07/09 12:51:13 Normand, Nicole June 7, Van-Nanaimo-Van, Helijet,
(IDIRINNORMAND) Ministerial event in Parksville, F day per
Nicole.Normand@gov.bc.ca diem -L/D

June 17, Van-Vic-Van HJ, AG mtgs, claimed
lunch per diem

June 18, Van, AG Mtgs, parking $19.00
June 19, Van, AG Mtgs, parking $19.00
June 20, Van, AG Mtgs, parking $19.00
June 21, Van-Ft St John-Van AC flight; taxi
$80.85, claim full day 61.00
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http://gww.eforms.gov.bc.ca/Libraries/PrintFormsShell.htm 2019-07-17












Page 3 of 3

Notes for Travel Voucher (Restricted Use) E131545 for Eby, David
1 note(s) returned.

Created On | Author | Note
2019/07/15 12:11:01 Normand, Nicole June 27, AG Ministry event/mtgs, parking
(IDIRINNORMAND) 18.75
Nicole.Normand@gov.bc.ca June 28, AG Ministry event/mtgs, parking

16.00 and 7.62, mileage to/fm Surrey 84 km
July 3, Van-Vic HJ, AG ministry mtgs, full
day -B/D 27.00

July 4, AG Ministry mtgs, parking 19.00
July 5, AG Ministry mtgs, parking 19.00
July 8, AG Ministry mtgs, parking 19.00
July 10, AG Ministry mtgs, parking 19.00
July 15, Van-Vic-Van HJ, AG Ministry mtgs,
full day -B/D 27.00
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AT20EXESLP32

Ministry of Finance RETURN CHEQUE TO MINISTRY?
INVOICE CODING SHEET (if yes, enter “D”)

FOREIGN CURRENCY OR WIRE?
(if yes, enter “$” for foreign and

Link to Invoice Coding Sheet completion instructions. - )
W” for Wire transfer)

PAYEE NAME BMO * SUPPLIER # 2081565 *SITE 001
CONTRACT/PO # INVOICE DATE 17-SEP-2019 INVOICE # 17SEP2019-KWADACHA
DD-MMM-YYYY
DATE INVOICE
RECEIVED 17-SEP-2019 DATE GOODS/ SERVICES REC'D RECEIPT #
DD-MMM-YYYY DD-MMM-YYYY
NAME &/OR ADDRESS OVERRIDE: DESCRIPTION FOR CHEQUE STUB:

GEN GLP Zero Dollar Balance
KWADACHA MEALS - MINISTER EBY AND JESSICA SMITH

DATE CHQ/EFT REQ'D
(ONLY IF URGENT) GL DATE (If applicable) PAY ALONE? YES I:‘

DD-MMM-YYYY DD-MMM-YYYY

OFA STOB & ASSET # (if applicable) :

PRE-TAX NAME &
PST GST TAX CODE SERVICE -
(IN(‘:.'L\TSI':IJ(?IAX) AMOUNT AMOUNT AMOUNT PST & GST, GST, PST, GST CL RESP LINE STOB PROJECT SUPPLIER # if
(EXCLUDING TAX) Travel, Other STOB 57
-289.54 -287.54 105 15002 10005 5702 1500000
P |
144.77 144.77 105 | 15002 | 10005 | 5702 | 150000 | DAVID EBY|armation
144.77 144.77 105 | 15002 | 10005 | 5702 | 150000 | personaiintormation
0.00 | TOTAL
* EXPENSE AUTHORITY (EA) INFORMATION: * QUALIFIED RECEIVER (QR) CERTIFICATION:
* DERRICK HARDER * SAIJA POLDRUGOVAC
EA PRINTED NAME QR PRINTED NAME
The goods provided or services delivered have been inspected or reviewed; and the goods or services were
* BRIEF PAYMENT DESCRIPTION FOR EA NOTIFICATION: properly received and documentation to support the account has been verified (i.e., goods: as ordered,

correct quantity and suitable quality; services: as contracted, appropriate deliverables and/or performance

Note: This is also the line description displayed on GL detail reports. e e
criteria met; or other conditions, if any, have been met).

QR SIGNATURE

ADDITIONAL INFORMATION OR INSTRUCTIONS:

* Note: Fields with an asterisk do not need to be completed for iProcurement invoices.
FIN FSA 017 REV. OCT/16




Poldrugovac, Saija FIN:EX

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

approved

Harder, Derrick AG:EX

September 17, 2019 3:51 PM

Poldrugovac, Saija FIN:EX

Normand, Nicole AG:EX

RE: FOR APPROVAL: KWADACHA ZERO DOLLAR INVOICES

From: Poldrugovac, Saija FIN:EX

Sent: Tuesday, September 17, 2019 10:52 AM

To: Harder, Derrick AG:EX <Derrick.Harder@gov.bc.ca>

Cc: Normand, Nicole AG:EX <Nicole.Normand@gov.bc.ca>
Subject: FOR APPROVAL: KWADACHA ZERO DOLLAR INVOICES

Hi Derrick,

The above 3 invoices are to attach the Minister and Jessica’s Kwadacha travel expenses to their supplier numbers. This
won’t initiate any payments as they will be entered as Zero Dollar in CAS. This is a step that we have to take as Court
Services didn’t attach the supplier numbers and it’s needed to ensure that public accounts are correct.

Please le me know if you have any questions. If not, a simple approval via email will suffice.

Thanks so much,

~Saija






Link to Invoice Coding Sheet completion instructions.

Ministry of Finance

INVOICE CODING SHEET

AT20EXESLP32

RETURN CHEQUE TO MINISTRY?
(if yes, enter “D”)

FOREIGN CURRENCY OR WIRE?
(if yes, enter “$” for foreign and
“W” for Wire transfer)

PAYEE NAME CENTRAL MOUNTAIN AIR LTD * SUPPLIER # 808550 *SITE 001
CONTRACT/PO # INVOICE DATE 17-SEP-2019 INVOICE # 17SEP2019-KWADACHA
DD-MMM-YYYY
DATE INVOICE
RECEIVED 17-SEP-2019 DATE GOODS/ SERVICES REC'D RECEIPT #
DD-MMM-YYYY DD-MMM-YYYY

NAME &/OR ADDRESS OVERRIDE:

DESCRIPTION FOR CHEQUE STUB:

GEN GLP Zero Dollar Balance
KWADACHA CHARTER - MINISTER EBY AND JESSICA SMITH

DATE CHQ/EFT REQ'D
(ONLY IF URGENT)

GL DATE (if applicable)

PAY ALONE? YES[]

DD-MMM-YYYY DD-MMM-YYYY
OFA STOB & ASSET # (if applicable) :
PRE-TAX NAME &
AMOUNT PST GST TAX CODE SERVICE .
(mcwng:::e %) AMOUNT AMOUNT AMOUNT bST & GST. GST, PST. GST cL RESP une | STOB | PROJECT SUPPLIER # if
(EXCLUDING TAX) Travel, Other STOB 57
-2,350.88 -2,350.88 105 | 15002 | 10005 | 5712 | 1SMTSA
C Government
1,175.44 1,175.44 105 | 15002 | 10005 | 5712 15"’35" DAVID EBY/ 72
1,175.44 1,175.44 105 | 15002 | 10005 | 5712 15"’25" cocssicasmmd_ - |
Information
0.00 | TOTAL

* EXPENSE AUTHORITY (EA) INFORMATION:

* DERRICK HARDER

*

* QUALIFIED RECEIVER (QR) CERTIFICATION:

SAIJA POLDRUGOVAC

EA PRINTED NAME

* BRIEF PAYMENT DESCRIPTION FOR EA NOTIFICATION:
Note: This is also the line description displayed on GL detail reports.

QR PRINTED NAME

The goods provided or services delivered have been inspected or reviewed; and the goods or services were
properly received and documentation to support the account has been verified (i.e., goods: as ordered,
correct quantity and suitable quality; services: as contracted, appropriate deliverables and/or performance
criteria met; or other conditions, if any, have been met).

QR SIGNATURE

ADDITIONAL INFORMATION OR INSTRUCTIONS:

* Note: Fields with an asterisk do not need to be completed for iProcurement invoices.

FIN FSA 017 REV. OCT/16



Poldrugovac, Saija FIN:EX

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

approved

Harder, Derrick AG:EX

September 17, 2019 3:51 PM

Poldrugovac, Saija FIN:EX

Normand, Nicole AG:EX

RE: FOR APPROVAL: KWADACHA ZERO DOLLAR INVOICES

From: Poldrugovac, Saija FIN:EX

Sent: Tuesday, September 17, 2019 10:52 AM

To: Harder, Derrick AG:EX <Derrick.Harder@gov.bc.ca>

Cc: Normand, Nicole AG:EX <Nicole.Normand@gov.bc.ca>
Subject: FOR APPROVAL: KWADACHA ZERO DOLLAR INVOICES

Hi Derrick,

The above 3 invoices are to attach the Minister and Jessica’s Kwadacha travel expenses to their supplier numbers. This
won’t initiate any payments as they will be entered as Zero Dollar in CAS. This is a step that we have to take as Court
Services didn’t attach the supplier numbers and it’s needed to ensure that public accounts are correct.

Please le me know if you have any questions. If not, a simple approval via email will suffice.

Thanks so much,

~Saija









Ministry of Finance

AT20EXESLP32

RETURN CHEQUE TO MINISTRY?

INVOICE CODING SHEET (if yes, enter “D”)
FOREIGN CURRENCY OR WIRE?
Link to Invoice Coding Sheet completion instructions. (if yes, enter ”$" for foreign and
“W” for Wire transfer)
PAYEE NAME TSAY KEH DENE BAND * SUPPLIER # 2642024 * SITE 001
CONTRACT/PO # INVOICE DATE 17-SEP-2019 INVOICE # 17SEP2019-KWADACHA
DD-MMM-YYYY
DATE INVOICE
RECEIVED 17-SEP-2019 DATE GOODS/ SERVICES REC’'D RECEIPT #
DD-MMM-YYYY DD-MMM-YYYY

NAME &/OR ADDRESS OVERRIDE:

DESCRIPTION FOR CHEQUE STUB:

GEN GLP Zero Dollar Balance
KWADACHA ACCOMODATION - MINISTER EBY AND JESSICA SMITH

DATE CHQ/EFT REQ'D ' )
(ONLY IF URGENT) GL DATE (if applicable) PAY ALONE? YES[]
DD-MMM-YYYY DD-MMM-YYYY
OFA STOB & ASSET # (if applicable) :
PRE-TAX NAME &
AMOUNT PST GST TAX CODE SERVICE .
(INCLUIgI':IJG TAX) AMOUNT AMOUNT AMOUNT PST & GST, GST, PST, GST CL RESP LINE STOB PROJECT SUPPLIER # if
(EXCLUDING TAX) Travel, Other STOB 57
-220.50 -220.50 105 15002 10005 | 5702 | 1500000
Governmen
Financial
220.50 220.50 105 | 15002 | 10005 | 5702 | 1500000 | DAVID EBY niormation
-220.50 -220.50 105 15002 10005 5702 1500000
220.50 220.50 105 15002 10005 | 5702 | 1500000 Goveﬂﬁ%ﬂﬁﬁpmmg.
Information
0.00 | TOTAL

* EXPENSE AUTHORITY (EA) INFORMATION:

*

DERRICK HARDER

*

* QUALIFIED RECEIVER (QR) CERTIFICATION:

SAIJA POLDRUGOVAC

EA PRINTED NAME

* BRIEF PAYMENT DESCRIPTION FOR EA NOTIFICATION:
Note: This is also the line description displayed on GL detail reports.

The goods provided or services delivered have been inspected or reviewed; and the goods or services were
properly received and documentation to support the account has been verified (i.e., goods: as ordered,
correct quantity and suitable quality; services: as contracted, appropriate deliverables and/or performance
criteria met; or other conditions, if any, have been met).

QR PRINTED NAME

QR SIGNATURE

ADDITIONAL INFORMATION OR INSTRUCTIONS:

* Note: Fields with an asterisk do not need to be completed for iProcurement invoices.

FIN FSA 017 REV. OCT/16



Poldrugovac, Saija FIN:EX

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

approved

Harder, Derrick AG:EX

September 17, 2019 3:51 PM

Poldrugovac, Saija FIN:EX

Normand, Nicole AG:EX

RE: FOR APPROVAL: KWADACHA ZERO DOLLAR INVOICES

From: Poldrugovac, Saija FIN:EX

Sent: Tuesday, September 17, 2019 10:52 AM

To: Harder, Derrick AG:EX <Derrick.Harder@gov.bc.ca>

Cc: Normand, Nicole AG:EX <Nicole.Normand@gov.bc.ca>
Subject: FOR APPROVAL: KWADACHA ZERO DOLLAR INVOICES

Hi Derrick,

The above 3 invoices are to attach the Minister and Jessica’s Kwadacha travel expenses to their supplier numbers. This
won’t initiate any payments as they will be entered as Zero Dollar in CAS. This is a step that we have to take as Court
Services didn’t attach the supplier numbers and it’s needed to ensure that public accounts are correct.

Please le me know if you have any questions. If not, a simple approval via email will suffice.

Thanks so much,

~Saija






























Monday, July 15, 2019

FARE-YWH-FULL_Summer2019 $228.57
" + 14
08:40 Vancouvér-Harbour (Downtown) e e e s e e e e 51 _3.
09:15 Victoria H'arba’&r\(powntown) P
ey Billing $228.57
35 minutes. N Taxes A $11.43

Confirmed _
Fu j-Changeable / Refundable up to 5pm the day prior to
1 Passengers - Off-Peak ’_.‘.»-«""departﬁre,\
. David Eby, Male ~ g _
e After S5pm all next-day travel is non-refundableand only

Add to Calendar changeable for same-day-travel. Any cancellations will result in

e a non-refundable cancellatich-fee equal to the value of the

i one-way travel. S

~

Failure.to change 1 hour prior or check-i‘mg,g minutes prior to

departure h
willalso resuit in the cancellation:of any onward and/or return
reseérvations

(additional cancellation fees may apply)

Govemment Financial Information

Monday, July 15, 2019
FARE:YWH-FULL_Summer2015 $228.57

16:55 Victoria Harbour (Downtown)

17:30 Vancouver Harbour {Downtown).

+GST $11.43

Billing $228.57

35 minutes Taxes $11.43

Confirmed
Fully Changeable / Refundable up to 5pm the day prior to

1 Passengers - Off-Peak departure,

David Eby, Male

.After Spm ali next-day. travel is non-refunda.ble and only

Add to Calendar ' changeable for sanie-day travel. Any cancellations will result in
anon-refundable cancellation fée equal to the value of the
one-way travel.






